NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026
OFFICIAL BID FORM - WITH ADDENDUM I (3/13/25)
DATE: 320/2025
VENDOR: |Roberts Chemical Co., Inc.
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIEDyON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) PAILS
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) BULK
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 - 5,000 GALLON
MSF 60/ANSI GAL. deliveries)
4 AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. LB.
CYLINDER
g AMMONIUM SULFATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
6 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 —1,000 GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) GAL. deliveries
7 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. CU.FT.
BAGS
8 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000-GAL. GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries
9 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30-GAL. GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15-GAL. GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM
11 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS 50.36
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12 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
13 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 - 50 LBS
LBS. BAGS
1 4 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue 5l by Fillion PAILS
Associates)
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. LBS.
(Accu-Tab Sl by Axiall LLC) PAILS
17 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY LB.
(40/50 LBS.
bags)
13 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
19 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
20 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRY LB.
21 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
GAL. deliveries
22 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000
GAL. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION DRUM $0.22
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 275-GAL. WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION TOTES
25 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500-1,500
GAL. deliveries
26 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
2? CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50-LBS. DRY LB.
PAILS
28 CHLORINE 1 TON LB.
CYLINDER
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29 CHLORINE 150-LBS. LE.
CYLINDER
30 CITRIC ACID 50% 250-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM
32 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET
33 COPPER SULFATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
FINE # 30 BAGS
34 COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38%
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
(Alternative Bid)
NEWATEM | SRABLN AR SETRGST RS- EANRO ok PRY-LB-
-37
NEWTEM GRAMUHAR-ACHVATED BULK DRY-LB-
-382 CARBOMN-
REGENERATED
39 HYDROFLUQSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LE.
40 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM
41 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 270-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES
NEW ITEM HYDROGEN PEROXIDE = 27% BULK GALS.
42 $410
43 LIME (HYDRATED) 50-LBS. BAGS DRY LB.
2-ton min.
44 LIME SLURRY BULK PER TOM
45 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<15 PPM THC)
46 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<40 PPM THC)
47 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL.
TOTES
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48 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL)
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275-GAL. GAL.
TOTES
50 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CU FT.
51 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CU FT.
(alternate bid)
52 METHAMOL (100%) 55-GAL. GAL.
DRUM $4 06
53 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 - 3,000)
GAL. delivered
54 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55-GAL, GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM
55 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520-LBS. LB.
DRUM sl 35
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-GAL. jugs GAL
per box
57 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
(300-350 GAL.)
58 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15-GAL. GAL.
CARBOY
59 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
(300-350 GAL.)
60 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50-LBS. LB.
(CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) PAILS
61 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUM
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL.)
63 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM
64 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB.
[Aquamag or equal)
65 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM
66 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55-GAL. LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM
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67 POLYPHOSPHATE 340-LBS. LB.
(STERLING CP-33) DRUM
68 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUM
8100)
Eg POLYMER (MANMNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321
70 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTES
71 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTES
72 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTES
?3 POLYMER 55-GAL. GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
74 POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL
SNF NE-1922 TOTES
75 POLYMER 55- GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC GAC
C6287
76 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL
BASF ZETEG 8848FS5 OR TOTES
PRAESTOL K290 FLY
77 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15-GAL. WET LB.
75% SOLUTION DRUM
?3 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL)
?9 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275-GAL . GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) TOTES
20 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
21 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL)
Q2 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
(EPIC 58) BULK GAL.
OR EQUAL
23 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 -1,000
GAL.
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Deliveries

84 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1,001 - 5,000
GAL. Deliveries
85 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 - 1,500 WET LB
GAL.- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
85 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES WET LB.
’7 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM 30569
38 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 15-GAL. WET LB.
PAILS
39 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM
gu POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM
91 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) DRUM
92 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) DRUM
93 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST)
94 SODIUM BICARBONMNATE BULK DRY LB.
{AWWA;" NSF 60)
95 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG DRY LE.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload
Release
096 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload
Release
9? SODIUM BICARBONATE S50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet $0158
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL.+
99 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL.
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100 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
38% SOLUTION DRUM
101 SODIUM 50-LBS. BAGS DRY LB.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet
delivery.
102 SODIUM CARBONATE S0-LBS. DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE BAGS sol2
103 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE
104 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
105 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 -LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS $01365
106 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY
107 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.5. ONLY DRUM
108 SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid)
109 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM
110 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for
Wastewater Use Only
1 1 Wl SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for DRUM
Wastewater Use Only
112 SODIUM CHLORITE = 55-GAL. DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) DRUM
113 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
114 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
115 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
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116 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50-
(Alternative Bid) LBS. BAGS
117 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS $2122
118 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55-GAL. WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641 DRUM
119 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES 501.23
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 5-GAL. WET LB.
CARBOYS S01889
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 GAL. WET LB.
BULK $0.244
133 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% SMALL BULK
400 - 1,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries | $0.244
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 - 7,000 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 GAL.
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries) WET LB.
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUMS SOL288
126 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE = 15% 275-GAL. WET.LB.
TOTES
127 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
128 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER  |5(1.375
129 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER Sl B89
130 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
131 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS
132 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2-KG. DRY KG.
(penta-hydrate) BAGS
NEW ITEM SODIUM THIOSULFATE 5- GAL. GAL
-133 (30% SOLUTION) DRUM
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134 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
135 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275-GAL. PER GAL.
(30%) TOTES
136 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
(V-937 OR EQUAL BAGS
137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL)
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE S50-LBS. DRY LB.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS DRUM
3180)
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES
3180)
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL. GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) PAILS
144 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(SLI-932 OR EQUAL)
145 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(V-939 OR EQUAL)
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL)
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)
148 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK GALLON
(CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL)
149 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(5LI-939 OR EQUAL)
150 Emergency Pumping and Daily Fee: Chemicals that
Storage Tanker to support bulk pumping
temporary on-site storage for and storage
utility that needs to repair will support:
containment vessel.
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PROPOSAL FROM:
Roberts Chemical Co., Inc.

330-B Victor Road

Attleboro, MA 02703

Telephone;  908-408-0220 email: achaudh

rey@robertschem.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attaj
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCG
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and |
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC,

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: Addends

“hed, it being further understood
) and our Host Community
o reject any or all bids it shall be

m |

Signature:

ﬁwﬁ%«:’:ﬁg«,

The addendum could state that if tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustment is needed,

vendors must provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, sug
tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. We should also clarify
due to new tariffs—not general inflation or other factors—will be

To Whom it May Concern:

plier invoices, or government
that only verified increases

considered.

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting

proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as g
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination h
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time s

SIGNATURES
Aamad

specifications, |/we hereby certify
rincipal(s); that it is made without

Bs been made of the specifications;

pecified, at the following prices.

Authorizing Signature
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Aamad Chaudhrey, President/CQO

Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

3/20/2025
Date

| certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowletige, have filed all state tax returns

and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory): ﬁmm:zf M‘?,

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): _ Aamad Chaudljrey, President/COO

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed

by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the

warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if app

licable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the

owner. The owner's intent is to use the extent of the coverage in th
of the awarding procedure.

ADDENDUM I

e warranties or guarantees as part

If tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustmen

[ is needed, vendors must

provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, supplier invoices, or government
tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. Only verjified increases due to new

tariffs, not general inflation or other factors—

will be considered.

Signature Aamad M?

Date 3/20/2025
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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026
OFFICIAL BID FORM — WITH ADDENDYM I (3/13/25)
DATE: 03/14/25
VENDOR: |Shannon Chemical Corporation
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIEZ} ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) PAILS rlo bid
9 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000-GAL. i GAL.
(ACH) BULK o bid
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 — 5,000 GALLON
NSF 60/ANSI GAL. deliveries) |no bid
4 AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. . LB.
cyunper | ° e
5 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS no bid
6 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 —1,000 GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) GAL. deliveries | 4o hid
7 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. . CU.FT.
BAGS no bid
g AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000-GAL, GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries | po bid
g CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30-GAL. GAL,
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM $9.72/gallon
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15-GAL. §18.37/gallon GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM _
11 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS 10 bid
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12 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
no I:,d
13 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 — 50 - 4 d LBS
LBS. BAGS
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 Lps |no bid
_ BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue Sl by Fillion PAILS no t‘ﬁd
Associates)
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. o AR LBS.
(Accu-Tab Sl by Axiall LLC) PAILS
i i DRY LB.
17 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery no Hid LB
(40/50 LBS.
hags}
18 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
no hid
19 CARBON POWDERED BULK no Hid TON
20 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK |no Hid DRY LB.
21 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALLBULK | L, WET LE.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
GAL. deliveries
22 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK _ WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 -5,000 Mo Rid
GAL. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - 55-GAL. no Hid WET LB.
25% SOLUTION DRUM
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 275-GAL. WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION TOTES no Bid
25 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 - 135D[J no ﬂ-id
GAL. deliveries
2% CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 -6,000 |no Bid WET LB.
GAL, deliveries
27 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50-LBS. DRY LE.
PAILS no Bid
28 CHLORINE 1TON ] LB.
CYLINDER  |M© '!""-’

T
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29 CHLORINE 150-LBS, LB.
CYLINDER | no Hid
30 CITRIC ACID 50% 250-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES  |$0.792/#
CITRIC ACID 50% 55-GAL, WET LE.
31 e $n.+2w#
32 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET |no bid
33 COPPER SULFATE 50-LBS, L DRY LB,
FINE # 30 BAGS no bid
34 COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50-LBS. no bid DRY LB.
BAGS
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK d DRY LB.
U.5. ONLY 329%-38% no bi
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38% no bid
(Alternative Bid)
MNEWLTEM | GRANULAR-ACTHMVATED-CARBOMN BULK DRY-LB-
-3F
NEW-ITEM GRANUAR-ACHVATED BULK DRY-LB.
-38 CARBON-
REGENERATED
39 HYDROFLUQSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
no }id
> ] _ B,
40 HYDROFLUQSILICIC ACID- 24% 5 ;ﬂﬁm_ no Bid WETL
a1 HYDROFLUQSILICIC ACID- 24% 270-GAL. no bid WET LB.
TOTES
NEW ITEM | HYDROGEN PEROXIDE — 27% BULK no bid GALS.
42
43 LIME (HYDRATED) 50-LBS. BAGS | no bid DRY LB,
2-ton min.
44 LIME SLURRY BULK Ao Tid PER TON
45 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK l GAL.
(<15 pPM THE) | 1O Bid
46 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK . GAL.
(<40 PPM THc) | No bid
47 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL.
TOTES no bid
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48 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK so.4rm WET LB,
8500 OR EQUAL)
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275-GAL, GAL,
TOTES no Hid
50 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK | CU FT.
no kid
51 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CU FT.
(alternate bid) no hid
59 METHANOL (100%) 55-GAL. : GAL.
DRUM no hid
53 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK no bid GAL.
{1,000 - 3,000}
GAL. delivered
54 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55-GAL. no bid GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM
RIATIC - 30" 520-LBS. LB.
55 Mu ACID- 20° BAUME e ot
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-GAL. jugs GAL
per box no bid
57 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
(300-350 GAL.) |no hid
58 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15-GAL. GAL.
CARBOY no hid
5g MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | PUMPTED TOTE | GAL.
(300-350 GAL.) |no Hid
60 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50-LBS. LB.
(CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) PAILS $2.36/#
61 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUM $9.37/gallon
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB,
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL.) |$1.38/#
£g ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM $1 -F-"#
64 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. $0.977/#
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB,
(Aguamag or equal)
65 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM $0.977/#
56 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55-GAL. g1 {4/t LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM
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67 POLYPHOSPHATE 340-LBS, LB.
(STERLING CP-33) DRUM $1. 12/
68 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUM $1127/gallon
8100)
69 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 no &d
70 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275-GAL. e ‘i d GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTES
71 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTES no hid
=5 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275-GAL, GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTES no kid
73 POLYMER 55-GAL. tL GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC CG287 DRUM no bid
74 POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL
SNF NE-1922 TOTES he'iyd
75 POLYMER 55- GAL. no Hid GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC GAC
C6287
76 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. no Hid GAL
BASF ZETEG BB848FS OR TOTES
PRAESTOL K290 FLY
By PHOSPHORIC ACID 15-GAL. WET LB,
75% SOLUTION DRUM $1.33/#
78 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) no Hid
79 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275-GAL . no Hid GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) TOTES
20 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL) no Hid
21 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE no Hid
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL)
87 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
(EPIC 58) BULK no hid GAL.
OR EQUAL
a3 SMALL BULK _ WET LB,
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400-1,000 |N° Hid
GAL.
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Deliveries
24 LARGE BULK | no Bid WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 1,001 - 5,000
GAL. Deliveries
85 BULK no bid
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 -1,500 WET LB
GAL.- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
26 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES [ bid WET LB,
a7 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% SDSI—I?J.:A. no bid WET LB.
38 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE = 45% 15-GAL. ! WET LB,
PAILS no bid
29 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE L5-LBS. no bid LB.
{U.S. OMLY) DRUM
a0 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. no bid LB.
(U.5. ONLY) DRUM
01 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. LB,
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) DRUM 52 H7/#
q?7 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. o LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) prRUM |92/
93 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B40S — LATEST) no {bid
94 SODIUM BICARBOMNATE BULK DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) HE:Py
g5 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG . DRY LB,
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload | N© Pid
. Release
95 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG no bid DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload
Release
9? SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG na bid DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet
98 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK no bid WET LB,
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL.+
99 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK . WET LB.
38% SOLUTION <800GAL, | o pid
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100 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
38% SOLUTION DRUM no bid
101 SODIUM 50-LBS. BAGS DRY LB.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet
delivery. no bid
102 SODIUM CARBONATE 50-LBS. ] DRY LB,
SODA ASH- DENSE BAGS no bid
103 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE no pid
104 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE no bid
105 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 -LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS no bid
106 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY no bid
107 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55-GAL. : WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY prum  |M0 P
108 SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK , WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) no pid
109 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL, . WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM no pid
110 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK no bid WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for
Wastewater Use Only
191 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. : WET LE,
no pid
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for DRUM
Wastewater Use Only
112 SODIUM CHLORITE - 55-GAL. DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) DRUM no bid
113 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50- ,
LBS. BAGS no pid
114 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50- nnFid
LBS. BAGS
115 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG no bid
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
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116 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL40BAG |no bid DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50-
(Alternative Bid) LBS. BAGS
27 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS, DRY LB.
BAGS o1.6354#
118 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55-GAL. WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641 pruM | S0-PO#
119 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES no pid
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 5-GAL. 7 WET LB.
carsoys | Mo pid
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 GAL. WET LB.
BULK no bid
127 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE—15% | SMALLBULK
400 - 1,000 no bid WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE ~ 15% LARGE BULK
1,001-7,000 |no bid WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK ]
Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 GAL. | no pid
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries) WET LB.
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% L55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUMS | no bid
126 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% 275-GAL. : WET.LB.
TOTES no bid
197 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER | no bid
198 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15-GAL. : WET LB.
conTaiNer MO pPid
129 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER  |no pid
130 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1-GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER no bid
139 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS  |no pid
132 SODIUM THIDSULFATE 2-KG. : DRY KG.
(penta-hydrate) BAGS g
NEWITEM |  SODIUM THIOSULFATE 5- GAL. | GAL
-133 (30% SOLUTION) DRUM no pid
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134 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK . PER TON
no bid
135 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275-GAL. PER GAL.
(30%) TOTES no bid
136 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
(V-937 OR EQUAL BAGS $1.63/#
137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. 1 '?j’# WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES ;
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK $1.04/# WET LE.
(V-970 OR EQUAL)
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. $0.pa4/# WET LB.
DRUM
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS $2.07/#
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON S5LC 321 OR CARUS DRUM $13.44/gallon
3180) =
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. " GAL.
142 | (sHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES Ty
3180)
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL.  |BIoEr0n ois GAL
fEAﬁ.UE 3180 OR EQUA L} PAILS fca per deliven
144 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LE.
(SLI-932 OR EQUAL) $0.811/#
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
145 " (V939 OR EQUAL) $0.874/#
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK $0.694/# WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL)
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK $2.07/8 WET LB.
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) r
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK l GALLON
ail (CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL) $7.p7igallon
149 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
($11-939 OR EQUAL) $0.7175¢
150 Emergency Pumping and Daily Fee: no bid Chemicals that
Storage Tanker to support bullk pumping
temporary on-site storage for and storage
utility that needs to repair will support:
containment vessel.
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PROPOSAL FROM: ; ;
Shannon Chemical Corporation

P.O. Box 376

Malvern, PA 19355

Telephone: ~ 610-363-9090 email: dcflynn@shannonchem.com
to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attaghed, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCQ and our Host Community

reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC,

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: #1

Signature: Danieb@,/ﬂ?nn, Fresident M il

Flynn,

ecretary

The addendum could.state that if tariffs are implemented and a corftract adjustment is needed,
vendors must provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, suTlim‘ invoices, or government

tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. We should also clarifyithat only verified increases
due to new tariffs—not general inflation or other factors—will be ¢onsidered.

To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached §pecifications, 1/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as pfincipal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time sgecified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES

DeH-

Authorizing Signature
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Daniel C. Flynn, President ) /
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

03/14/25
Date

Flynn, Secretary

| certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory): EhannuL Chemical Corporation

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): b (/}O"‘" Daniel C. Flynn, President

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unlesq this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantges must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major -::n::-mr:nnents as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if appligable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the

owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in thejwarranties or guarantees as part
of the awarding procedure,

ADDENDUM I

IT tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustment |s needed, vendors must
provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, suppligr invoices, or government
tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. Only verifjed increases due to new
tariffs, not general inflation or other factors—will be considered.

Signature B (/)’) ~— Daniel C. Flynr}, President

Date 03/14/25

*Shannon Chemical addressed the Tariff concerns in a separate email
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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026

OFFICIAL BID FORM - WITH ADDENDUM | (3/13/25)

DATE: 3/18/2025
VENDOR: Univar Solutions USA, LLC
200 Dean Sievers Place, Momisville, PA 19087
NOTE; BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED N THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15-GAL, GAL.
(ACH) PAILS No Bid
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) BULK No Bid
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 — 5,000 No Bid GALLON
NSF 60/ANSI GAL. deliveries)
A AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. LB.
CYLINDER $4.94
5 ~ AMMONIUM SULFATE 50-LBS. 40.92** DRY LB.
S BAGS
6 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 —1,000 | GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) GAL. deliveries | Mo Bid
7 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. CU.FT.
BAGS Mo Bid
8 AQUEQUS AMMONIA 1,000-GAL., GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries 52.05
9 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30-GAL. _ GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM Mo Bid
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15-GAL. , GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM No Bid
11 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS $0.4283
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13 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE F.n"-"LLLET,I"ED =50 £3.10 LBS
LBS. BAGS
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN $4.20 LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. No Bid LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue 51 by Fillion PAILS
Associates)
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. No Bid LBS.
(Accu-Tab S by Axiall LLC) PAILS
17 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery ; DRY LB.
(40/50 LBS. Np Bid
bags)
BULK LB.
18 CARBON DIOXIDE UL No Bid
CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
13 No Bid
20 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK q‘m Bid DRY LB.
21 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK i) 1484 WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
GAL. deliveries
22 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK 1099 WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000 &
GAL. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - L5-GAL. 2488 WET LB.
25% SOLUTION DRUM 0.
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 275-GAL. $d.1830 WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION TOTES
25 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALLBULK | 40,2053 WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 -1,500
GAL. deliveries
26 CAUSTIC SODA = LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 $0.1745 WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
- - : " DRY LB.
2}" CHLORINE DFt‘l"I:HTH:I EF'DAI;E;.% No Bid
28 CHLORINE 1 TON : LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
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CYLINDER
CITRIC ACID 50% 250-GAL. WET LB.
30 ***Price fluctuations possible TOT $0.79**
pending tariffs,"** ES
CITRIC ACID 50% 55-GAL. WET LB.
31 *Price fluctuations possible T $0.8475%
pending tariffs."**
32 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER S0-LBS. $1.27 DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET
33 COPPER SULFATE 50-LBS. $2 48 DRY LB.
FINE # 30 BAGS >
34 COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50-LBS. _ DRY LB.
BAGS Mo Bid
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK : DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38% HNo Bid
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK do Bid DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
(Alternative Bid)
NEWITEM | GRAMNLHAR-ACTHVATED-CARBON BULK DRYAB-
37
BRI e [T Y L i o R BliLk DRy
28 CARBON-
REGEMNERATED
39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK $0.30 WET LB.
40 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55-GAL. $0.57 WET LB.
DRUM
HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 270-GAL. ; WET LB.
41 TOTES No Bid
NEWITEM | HYDROGEN PEROXIDE —27% BULK . GALS.
42 No Bid
LIME (HYDRATED S50-LBS. BAGS . DRY LB.
43 *“**Price ﬂuc&uatiﬂna p-nss]ihlﬂ It . $0.3998
pending tariffs.”** et
LIME SLURRY BULK , PER TON
44 g No Bid Re
45 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK : GAL.
(<15 PPM THC) | No Bid
45 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<40 PPM THC) | No Bid
47 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. ) GAL.
TOTES No Bid
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48 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK | WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL)
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 2‘1}:5;5; L, 67 56 GAL.
50 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK No Bid CU FT.
51 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK . CU FT.
(alternate bid) ffio Bid
METHANOL (100% 55-GAL. GAL.
52 { } DRUM No Bid
53 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK _ GAL.
(1,000-3,000) | MyoBid
GAL. delivered
54 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55-GAL. No Bid GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM
- 20° BAUM 520-LBS. LB.
55 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 20D No Bid
=20 -GAL. j : GAL
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1;:-::&;-:-;"35 Lo Bid
MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK . GAL.
o7 (300-350 GAL) | o Bid
ATIC ACID — 20% 15-GAL. GAL.
58 MURIATIC Lol Lo Bid
59 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | PUMPTED TOTE | GAL.
(300-350 GAL.) | Mo Bid
60 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50-LBS. LB.
(CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) PAILS No Bid
1 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. ; GAL.
6 (CARUS 4500) DRUM Mo Bid
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK _ LB,
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL.) Mo Bid
63 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM No Bid
64 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM No Bid LE.
(Aguamag or equal)
65 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. o LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM Sl
66 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55-GAL. . LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM o Bid
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57 POLYPHOSPHATE 340-LBS. do Bid LB.
[STEHLING CP-33) DRUM
68 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30-GAL. , GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUM No Bid
8100)
69 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK . LB,
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 No Bid
70 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275-GAL. o GAL.
SNE POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTES
? 1 POLYMER {C.ﬁTIUNlE} 275 GAL. id AL,
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTES No Bi
=3 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTES No Bid
73 POLYMER 55-GAL. GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM No Bid
74 POLYMER 275-GAL. _ GAL
SNF NE-1922 TOTES Mo Bid
75 POLYMER 55- GAL. No Bid GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC GAC
C6287
o5 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. _ GAL
Mo Bid
BASF ZETEG 8848FS OR TOTES
PRAESTOL K290 FLY
- i WET LB.
77 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15-GAL ey ET
75% SOLUTION DRUM
?E POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK g GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
79 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275-GAL . _ GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) TOTES Mo Bid
30 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK ‘ GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL) No Bid
31 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE :
No Bid
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL)
82 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE ‘
(EPIC 58) BULK Mo Bid GAL.
OR EQUAL
33 SMALL BULK o e WET LE.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 —1,000
GAL.
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Deliveries
84 LARGE BULK $0.3525 WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1,001 - 5,000
GAL. Deliveries
85 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 - 1,500 Na Bid WET LB
GAL.- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
26 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES | WET LB.
B'? POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55-GAL. : WET LB.
DRUM Mo Bid
> = , WET LB.
38 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1§S&L 40.9685
- LE.
89 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM
90 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. $4.08 LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM
2 LB.
1 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-1LBS. s
9 (FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) DRUM No Bid
§ LB.
92 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. ;
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) DRUM No Bid
o WET LB.
93 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK )
(AWWA B405 — LATEST) No Bid
94 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK No Bid DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60)
SODIUM BICARBONATE S50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
AT25
99 (AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload ¥
Release
gE SODIUM BICARBONATE S0-LBS. BAG $0.4725 DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload :
Release
- DRY LB.
9? SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet $0.4725
o8 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK sb.1975 WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL.+ '
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL.
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100 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55-GAL. | WET LB.
38% SOLUTION DRUM p-3667
101 SODIUM 50-LBS. BAGS DRY LE.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet 5.6657
delivery.
] DRY LB.
102 SODIUM CARBONATE 50-LBS. 4746
SODA ASH- DENSE BAGS $
103 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS T DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE -
104 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK %2918 DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
105 SODIUM CHLORIDE sg:éass. e DRY LB.
106 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK e WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY
107 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55-GAL. s WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY DRUM
108 SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK _ WET LB,
FOREIGN (alternate bid) No Bid
z : WET LB.
109 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. |
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM to:Bid
110 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK _ WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for No Bid
Wastewater Use Only
111 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. e WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for DRUM
Wastewater Use Only
112 SODIUM CHLORITE — 55-GAL. Koeid DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) DRUM
B.
113 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY L
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG pile
PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
114 U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50- plLes
LBS. BAGS
115 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESSTHANFULL | [ DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG :
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
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116 SODIUM FLUQRIDE FULL 40 BAG $1.36 DRY LB,
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50- §
(Alternative Bid) LBS. BAGS
117 | SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. No Bid DRY LB.
BAGS
118 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55-GAL. No Bid WET LB.
PRISTIME SK-7641 DRUM
119 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% R ko WET LB.
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 5-GAL. _ WET LB.
120 CARBOYS LA
127 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 GAL. : WET LB.
BULK No Bid
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% SMALL BULK & 1980
+15% Sodium Hypochiorte by Volume, 400 - 1,000 WET LB.
1eam Dy e GAL. deliveries
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK I
*15% Sodum Hypochiorte by Vakume 1,001-7,000 | ¥1540 WET LB.
L s GAL. deliveries
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK s
Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 GAL. fNo Bid
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries) WET LB.
125 | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55-GAL. P WET LB.
DRUMS
12 E SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% I?Fg-_?él., 52871 WET.LB.
12? S0DIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30-GAL. Mo Bid WET LB.
CONTAINER
128 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15-GAL. 6166 WET LB.
CONTAINER T
129 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5-GAL. rJ _ WET LB.
CONTAINER o Bid
13{] SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1-GAL. Mo Bid WET LB.
CONTAIMNER
IDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
131 SODIUM SILICOFLUOR i No Bid
132 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2-KG. ) DRY KG.
(penta-hydrate) BAGS hio Bid
NEW ITEM SODIUM THIOSULFATE 5- GAL. Nb Bid GAL
-133 (30% SOLUTION) DRUM

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages | FY 2025-2026)
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SU
134 LFUR DIOXIDE BULK P PER TON
135 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275-GAL. 58.00 PER GAL.
(30%) TOTES
136 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. == DRY LB.
(V-937 OR EQUAL BAGS Vi
137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. . WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES e
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK , WET LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) [eRd
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. : WET LB
DRUM No Bid ’
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS No Bid
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS DRUM No Bid
3180)
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES No Bid
3180)
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL. . GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) PAILS No Bid
144 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK , WET LB.
(SLI-932 OR EQUAL) et
145 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(V-939 OR EQUAL) No Bid
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK \ WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) po i
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK , WET LB.
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) No Bid
148 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK GALLON
(CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL) No Bid
149 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
(SLI-939 OR EQUAL) No Bid
150 Emergency Pumping and Daily Fee: Chemicals that
Storage Tanker to support MNo Bid bulk pumping
temporary on-site storage for and storage
utility that needs to repair will support:
containment vessel.
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2025-2026) 9 of 11 pages




PROPOSAL FROM:
Univar Solutions USA, LLC

200 Dean Sievers Place

Morrisville, PA 19067

215-495-8502 ileana.cal

Telephone: email:

allero@univarsolutions.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications att
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVC
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: #1, dal

hed, it being further understood
) and our Host Community
to reject any or all bids it shall be

ed 3/13/2025

Sboana Caballirs

Signature:

lleana ¢

zaballero, Municipal Specialist

The addendum could state that if tariffs are implemented and a cohtract adjustment is needed,

vendors must provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, suj
tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. We should also clarifi
due to new tariffs—not general inflation or other factors—will be

To Whom it May Concern:

plier invoices, or government

that only verified increases
considered.

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack \alley Chemical Consortium inviting

proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached

specifications, |/we hereby certify

that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time

SIGNATURES
~Sbzna Crbalons

s been made of the specifications;
ecified, at the following prices.

Ein:ipal{s}; that it is made without

Authorizing Signature

lleana Caballero, Municipal Specialist

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2025-2026)
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lieana Caballero, Municipal Specialist

Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

3M8/2025

Date

| certify under the penalty of perjury that I, to the best of my knowle
and paid all state taxes required under law.

dge, have filed all state tax returns

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory): Univar Solutions USA, LLC

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): f\//m C

i:aéﬁ%w

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed

by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed

proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major cor
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if apg

nponents as well as a copy of the
licable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the

owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in th
of the awarding procedure.

ADDENDUM I

e warranties or guarantees as part

If tariffs are implemented and a contract adjustmen} is needed, vendors must
provide documentation (e.g., import/export data, supplier invoices, or government

tariff schedules) to prove the actual impact. Only ve
tariffs, not general inflation or other factors—

Signature Nbearna Caballers

fied increases due to new
will be considered.

lleana Caballero, Municipal Specialist

Date  3/18/2025

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2025-2026)
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Univar Solutions

200 Dean Sievers Place Hh Uni\fﬂ FSC}|U'tiDﬂ5

Morrigville, PA 12067-3700
LUSA

T 215-428-6990
F 215-337-6290

www_Lnivarsolutions.com

March 18, 2025

Northeast Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium
c/o Savas Danos

71 Pine Valley CT

Rotonda West, FL 33947

RE: FY2025-2026 Invitation to Cooperative Bid

To Whom It May Concern:

Univar Solutions is pleased to provide pricing for the above bid, due March 20, 2025, and has
done so on the attached required paperwork.

Our contact information for all things bid and contract related, as well as the information for
vour local branch, is also attached.

We look forward to hearing the results of your request. Please sdnd bid tabulations to the
email address below.

Thank you,

Ileana Caballero-

Municipal Specialist

215-495-8502

Univar Solutions USA, LLC
ileana.caballero@univarsolutions.com

muniteam-east@univarsolutions.com

Please Note: Seller shall indemnify Buyer for losses to the extent caused by Seller's negligence or breach of contract. Neither
party is liable for incidental or consequential damages. Seller's liability is limited to thelpurchase price of the goods. SELLER
MAKES NO WARRANTY OF MERCHANTABILITY OR FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE.

Please Note: Where applicable, any State, Federal or other appropriate taxes and/or the California Mill Assessment will appear
as separate line items on any invoices from Univar. If Univar's offer (pricing) was iﬂf'”j"ﬁ‘ of these charges — they will be backed
out of the “product” line item and shown as their own line item(s) at the time of billin




Univar Solutions

200 Dean Sievers Place
Sy = ﬁ‘ UnivarSolutions
T 215 428-6980 Irnrmovatel Grow saelher
F 215 337-6290

www Lmivarsalubions com

Branch Contact Information

Bids and contracts: Univar Solutions USA Inc.
lleana Caballero, Municipal Specialist

200 Dean Sievers Place, Morrisville, PA 19067
(215) 495-8502**phone**
(215) 3376290 **fax**

lleana caballero@univarsaglutions.com

Emergencies, chemical r - ChemTrec
(800) 424-9300
Emergencies, after hours: Main number:

(401) 781-5600 - please fallow prompts
Mike Papa, Operations Mahager

(401) 641-0544
A nt Manager Billy DeSousa
508-258-6360
Orders and delivery:
(855) 888-8648
CustSolNorthEast@univargolutions com
Business hours are Monday - Friday, 8 am — 5 pm
Remittance address: Univar Solutions USA Inc.

62190 Collections Center Orive
Chicago, IL 60693-0621

Payment terms are Net 30 Days




DESCHRTION OF OPERATIONS LOCATIONS VEMICLES (ACORD 101, Addaloral Remarks Schodule, may ba attachad i more space bs rfquind)
Evidence of Insurance.

ACORLDF DATE(MM DD Y¥vY
et CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 05 05 2024
THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIQHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERATIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR MEGATIVELY AMEMD, EXTEND OR ALTER COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURAMCE DODES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEM THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.
IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy{ies) must have ADDHEFIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If E
SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies mjy reguire an endorsement. A statement on this =
certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s). -
PRODUCER e+ e -
aon Risk Services Central, Inc. ERORE = Fis T
philadelphia pa OfFice AC. Mo Exty: (860) 283°7147 | 182 ;290236120105 g
100 worth 18th Street E-Ma -
1&1_:;]1 Flgur_ ADORESS. T
P hia PA
idcatuila LU SUEA msumsm-.‘- AFFORDING COVERAGE HAIC #
INSURED IMSURER A ACE ameridan Insurance Company 1 22667
Univar Solutions USA LLC INSURER B ACE Fire inderwriters Tnturance Co. 20702
égﬁeus 3] and: Parkway IMSURER £ Indemnity @nsurance Co of Morth america (43575
Downers Growve IL BOS1S usa R —
IEABRER £
HSRER F:
COVERAGES e CERTIFICATE NHUMBER: 570106229214 REVISION NUMBER:
THES IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURAMCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE IRSURED MAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIDD
INDICATED, NOTWITHS TANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR. CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESERIBED HEREIM I5 SUBIECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES, LTS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAIDCLAIMS. Limits shown are as requested)
ﬁ TYPE OF INSURANCE ‘w POLICY NUMBER LATS
¥ | COMMERCIAL GEMERAL LIABILITY x5L E*fﬂ}! ) v ik EACH OCCURBERNCE l £3, 000, 000
_ r - IR applies per palicy terps & condifions DERAGE TORERTED =1
cuams mace [ x| ocous PREMISES, [Fs domereres) 53,000,000
MED EXP {Anvy che pevson] Ex ﬂudﬂ
._:I" W = - : PERSOMALA SDURLLAY | §3,000,000 =z
'_*'[L.u_ AGGREGATE LT APPLEES PER [ ' CiEMERAL AGGHEGGATE 53 o 00 OO0
X | PoLcY T, _I LOC : | PRODLCTS - COMPOP AGH £3, 000,000 E
OTHER | E
A | AuTOMOBILE LIABKLITY {154 H10704741 0607/ 2024]067/01 J202 5| COMBINED SINGLE LIWIT $5. 000, 000 -
{Commarcial auta | B R g2 ey ek At [
[« | anvauTo | | | BOOELY HILIRY | Par parsan §
eri{ NED i'} I-II':I.'I:-IIIFF- | BODILY SUURY Par ,,.-.-,.,- : ___________ = a
CeREe AL, l__i it ; [ PROPERTY CAWAGE 8
_| LY t ALITLS LY | | L A 155, i _I. - e —— e %
|| UMBRELLALIAB GG 1| - [eachoccumpence [ 3] S
| Excess Lan CLAIS LACE AGGRECGATE 5
t!Eb] [RETENTION | | E
C | WORKERS COMPENSATION AND | WLRCSOI0IT T2 OB/ 07 2024 06/ U1 g0 % | PERSTATUTE | |oTw
EMPLOYERS LLABILITY i YoM ADS I_IER 4 TR T
gL TR AR (AR LS ) [l ea SCFC70303715 06/07/ 202410601 025 L EAMAALLIENT 31,000,000
(Mangulary in HH| e | W [E L DISEASE EA EMPLOYVEE 15,000, 000
D& SEAIPTION DF DPERATIONS belsa 1 E.L DISEASE POLICY LIMIT 11,000,000 —v
| | | |
| | i i 5

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABDVE SCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFGRE THE
EXFIRATION DATE THEREOGF, NOT WLl BE DELIWVERED IN ADCORDAMCE WATH THE
PROHLICY PROVISSDMS.

Univar Solutigns USA LLC ALUTHORIZED REPAESENTATIVE
dba inivar Solutions LS4

7S Highland Parkway, suite 200 2
Downers Growve IL GOSLS LSA ‘% %ﬂfﬁ h li;,g‘.‘i gf
Frey

21988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2016/03) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

WTRERRES TR
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L L )

LT R L R

,..-——-Ef LOC #:
A= ADDITIONAL REMARKS SCHEDULE e ute

Aon RisK Services Central, Inc,

POLICY NUMBER
see Certificate Mumber:

370106229214

CARRIER

See Certificate Mumber: 570106229214

MR COOE

Univar Solutions

USaA LLC

EFFECTIVE DATE

ADDITIONAL REMARKS

THIS ADDITIONAL REMARKS FORM IS A SCHEDULE TO ACORD FORM,
FORM NUMBER: ACORD 25 FORM TITLE: Cenificate of Liability Insurance

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE

NAIC #

INSLRER

INSURER

INSURER

INSURER

ADDITIONAL POLICIES

If a policy below does not include limit information., refer w the

certificate furm for policy limits,

dorresponding policy on the ACORL

ExCess WC-=-Ca OH OR, WA
5IF applies per policy te

ms & conditjons

I8 A, 41 HE PLRLICY XM BER "l-::::-‘ril.- X ';_'::;:.,., (LT e
(R TVPE O 151 BARDE rana e ik A
R ATE CES S AR TN METLY (TN RRY
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY
A wuT H10704856 06/07/2024] 06/91/2025 |[cosbired 5 . 000 . 000
Truckers Liabilicy single Limi
WIRRERS COMPENSATION
A NSA WCUCTOR03TI5 D6/07 /2024 D691/ 2025

ACORD 101 [2008/01)

The ACORD name and logo are regisiered marks of ACORD

0 2008 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.



Form W-Q Request for Taxpayer Give form to the
tFiev. March 2024) Identification Number and Certifigation requester. Do not
mmmml .,"I ETIMHH Go to www.irs. gov/FormW9 for [nstructions and the latest Informaticn. send to the IRS.

Before you begin. For guidance redated io the purpose of Form 'W-9, aee Purpose of Form, below.

enlity’s namea an ine 2.}
Univar Solutions USA LLC

1 Mame of entityindividual. An sniry is requined. (For a sole propriston or disregarded entity, enter the owher's name on ine 1, and enfer the business/disregarded

2 Businsss ramadaregarded sntity name, if different from above.
Univar Solutions USA

anty one of the follgwing seven boxes.

o Tor 1he e classilication of is dwiner
] Other (ses instructions]

3a Check the appropriate box for lederal tax classification of the enlity/individusl whoss nams s enlered gn ine 1, Check

[ individuak'sote proprister ] Cearporation  [] Scoporation  [] Parnership [} Trusvestate

. LLE. Erfar tha lax classificalicn |C = C corporalion, 8 = 5 conpovalion, P = Parnarship) YA P
Mota: Chack tha “LLE" box above and, in 1hae antry Space, ender tha appropriate code (C, 5, nrl'}hmu:
classifcation of the LLC, undess it is a disregarded entity. A deregarded entity should instead checkiithe appropriale

4 Examplions jcodss apply onty 19
cartain andilias, rol mdividuals;
586 insructions on page Iy

Exampt payes coda (if any)
Exemption frem Foresgn Account Tax

Campliance Act [FATCA) reporting
eode {if &)

Print or type.

3b If on lina 3a you checked “Partrership” or "TrusUestate,” or checkad "LLE" and enlered “P~ a8 its lax
and you are providing Bhis lorm o & parinership, lmd.drﬂlﬂl-\nl'ibhrﬁuhlﬂmwmﬁph , chack
this boxt if yau have arry lareign pariners, cwners, o benaliciaries. Seeinsluctions . . . . Tl .D Guisice the Linfied States }

fication, {(Appliet 18 secounts maintained

5 Address [numbaer, sireel, and api. or SuUs no.). Ses FBICToNE,
3075 Highland Parkway, Suite 200

See Specific Instruclions on page 3.

Bequesis’s name and address (oplional)

6§ Chy, state, and ZIF code
Downers Grove, IL 60515-5560

T Ligt aceoun! numissns] hama foptanal)

N Taxpayer identification Number (TIN)

Enfter your TIN in the appropriate box. Th

TIN, laber.

Mote: If the account is in more than one namae, see the inatructions for line 1. See also What Name agd
Number To Give the Requesier for guidelines on whose number 0 enter.

& TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avo
backup withholding. For individuals, this is genaerally your social security number (S5N). However, lod a
residant alien, sole propristor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Pan |, later. For olher
entities, it is your employer idenlification numbaer (EIN}. If you do not have a number, see How to get aor

JHE L [LNEE

1/3|(4|7(|9|3|5

| Employer

MT_

I  Certification

Under penaities of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identificalion numiber [of | am waiting for anumbser 1o be Ssued 1o me) and

2. | am not subject lo backup withholding because (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or [b) | have not been notified by the Internal Revenus
Sarvice (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure 1o report a4 interest ordividends, or (c) the |RS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withhelding; and
3. | am a U.8, citizen or other U5, person [defined below); and

4, The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA

Certification instructions. You must cross out llem 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that
because you have failed Lo report all inlerest and dividends on your tax retumn. For real estale transacl
acquisition or abandonment of secured property, canceliation of debi, contribulions to an individual ratir
oiher than interest and dividends, mﬂqunlmmntwum

correct.
are currently subject fo backup withholding
item 2 does nol apply, For morigage interest paid,

| arangement JRA), and, generally, pl:nnmts
correct TIN. See the nstructions for Part I, laber

Sign le'llh.uml of i
Here | u.s. person o

General Instructions

Seaction referancas are to the Infernal Ravenss Code unlass olherwise
noted.

Futuré developments. For the latest infarmation aboul developments
related to Form W-9 and its instructions, such as lagislation enacted

after they were published, go o www. irs. gov/FormiWs.

What's New

Line 3a has been modified o clarify how a disregarded enlity completes
this lina. An LLC that is a disregarded entity should chack the
appropriate box for the tax classiffication of its owner, Othenaise, it
should check the "LLC" box and enter [is appropriate tax classification.

o ?Ma%-?&ﬁiaﬁ'—

I'-mw-raahm added to this formi. A flow-through entily is
fine 1o Indicate that it has direct or indinec

foralgn partners, , or banaficiarias wien il provides tha Form W-9
1o another fiow- antity in which it has an ownership interest. This
change ks intended 1 de a flow-through entity with information
regarding the status of ils indirect foreign pariners, owners, or
beneficiaries, so that & can satisty any applcable reporting
requirements. For a, a partnership thal has any indiract foraign
partners may be recqu to complete Schedules K-2 and K-3. See the

for Schedules K-2 and K-3 (Form 1065).

W9 reqguestar) who is required o file an
information return wilh the IRS is giving you this form because thay

Caat. Bo. 10F31K

Foem W =8 Fov. 3-2024)
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DocuSign Envelope ID: 72B37213-ABEF-48A2-981A-868E2883B472

I, Jumoke Onibokun, hereby certify that:

1. Tamtheduly elected,qualified and acting Assistant S

N

CERTIFICATE OF SECRETARY]

USA LLC,a Washington Limited Liability Compan
custodian of the corporate records of the Compan
matters herein certified.

2 The below list of persons are authorized to execut

Company, written municipal bids or municipal prop
disposition of products up to $8 million handled by the (

Victoria Meakim - Municipal Specialis|
Roise Holiday-Henry- Municipal Specia
Jennifer Perras — Sr. Municipal Speciali

Shelley Riggle - Municipal Specialist
Stacy Ziegler- Municipal Specialist

Raven Claudio - Municipal Specialist
Ileana Caballero — Municipal Specialis

UnivarSolutions

retary of Univar Solutions
the "Company"), and ama
and am familiar with the

2, for and on behalf of the
osals for the sale of other
~ompany.

Shawnasey McCarthy- Municipal Commercial Manager

e

IN WITENESS WHEREOF, I have executed this Certificate of Secretary of the Company this 4* day of

January 2024,

State of [llinois

County of DuPage

This Certificate of Secretary was signed and sworn before me on this

Jumoke Onibokun, Assistant Secretary of Univar Solutions USA LLC.

OFFICIAL SEAL E

SANEMA GORODETSKY

Seal

)
)
)

MNOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
My Commission Expires 7/25/2026

([ Bt

- ETR14TTERALELTO

Jumoke Onibokiin, Assistant Secretary

Notary Public

1" day of January 2024 by

igned by:

T

Sanema Gorodetsky

My commissiof expires July 25, 2026




Good Morning Savas,

Regarding the preliminary bid results for items # 122 & 123, there is an error on the results, Sodium
Hypochlorite, You listed “TARRIFF IMPACT", that is not correct.
Bid form is stating the following:

19 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% SMALL BULK s 1980

**15% Sodiun Hypochlorite by Volume, 400 - 1,000 WET LB.
ot Ty GAL. deliveries

123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% LARGE BULK -
21%:; Sodium Hypochlorite by Volume, 1,001 - 7,000 $.1540 WET LB.
SEaia GAL. deliveries

Can you please correct & advise?

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.




