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D;

NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024
OFFICIAL BID FORM
DATE: 3/22/2023
VENDOR: Church & Dwight Co., Inc.
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL.
({ACH} PAILS
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. GAL.
{ACH) BULK
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK .
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric ;| Gal. deliveries)
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANS!
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 - 5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal. deliveries)
Alternative Bid
NSF 60/ANS}
5 AMMONIA GAS 15018. 1B.
CYLINDER
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 - 1,000 GAL.
{40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries
g ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. BAGS CULFT.
9 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID)
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11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15 GAL. DRUM GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID)
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 — 50 LBS
LBS BAGS
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLCRITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS
BAGS
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 1LBS 1BS
(Accu-Tab Blue Sl by Fillion PAILS
Associates)
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS. LBS.
(Accu-Tab S| by Axiall LLC) PAILS
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY LB.
(40/50 Ib. bags)
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK DRY LB.
22 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
Gal. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 -5,000
Gal. deliveries
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL. TOTE WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 - 1,500
Gal. deliveries
27 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 WTLB.
Gal. deliveries
28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50 LB. PAILS DRY LB.
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29 CHLORINE 1 TON LB.
CYLINDER
30 CHLORINE 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GALTOTE WET LB.
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM WET LB.
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER S50LB DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET
343 COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
FINE # 30
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38%
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
(Alternative Bid)
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
38 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
39 HYDROFLUQSILICIC ACID- 24% 270 gallon totes WET LB.
A0 LIME {(HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS DRY LB.
2 ton min.
41 LIME SLURRY BULK PERTON
42 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
{<15 PPM THC)
43 1IQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<40 PPM THC)
44 LIQUID POLYMER 275 GALTOTE GAL.
45 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL)
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275 GAL TOTES GAL.
New ltem
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47 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CUFT.
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CU FT.
{alternate bid)
49 METHANDL (100%) 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
50 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 - 3,000)
gallon delivered
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified
52 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520 LB. DRUM LB.
53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-gallon jugs GAL
per box
54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
{300-350 gal)
55 MURIATIC ACID ~- 20% 15 GAL. GAL.
CARBQOY
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
{300-350 gal)
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 LB PAILS LB.
NEW ITEM (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL)
58 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUMS
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL)
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
{50%-50% Biend) DRUM
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSFPHATE 55 GALLON
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB.
{Aquamag or equal)
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
{30%-70% BLEND) DRUM
63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON LB.
(10%-90% OQRTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM LB.
{STERLING CP-33)
65 PHOSPHATE {LIQUID) 30 GALLON GAL.
(SHANNON SL1 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS
8100)
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66 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321
67 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTE
68 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE
69 POYMER {CATIONIC) 275 GAL, GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE
70 POLYMER 55 GAL GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
75% SOLUTION
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL)
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GALTOTE GAL
{HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL)
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL.
{HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
{HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL)
76 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 -1,000 gal.
Deliveries
77 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1,001 - 5,000
Gal. Deliveries
78 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 - 1,500 gal WET LB
- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE WET LB.
20 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
81 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 15 GAL. PAIL WET LB.
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB.
{U.S. ONLY)
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83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM ! LB.
(U.S. ONLY)
84 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS LB.
(U.S. ONLY)
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid)
26 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)
87 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS LB8.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)
28 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B405 - LATEST)
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60} $0.3790
90 SOOIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload | $0.3650
Release
91 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
{WASTEWATER ) Full Truekload $0.3650
Release
92 SODIUM BICARBONATE S0 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+
94 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL
95 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB,
38% SOLUTION
96 S50DIUM 50 LBS BAGS DRY LB.
METABISULFITE {GRANULAR) 2 pallet deliv.
97 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
98 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE
9% SODIUM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
S0ODA ASH- DENSE
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
101 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY
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102 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY
103 SODIUM CHLORITE - 25% BULK WET LB.
FOREIGN {alternate bid)
104 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
FOREIGN {alternate bid)
105 S0DIUM CHLORITE — BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
wastewater use only
106 SODtUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
wastewater use oniy
107 SODIUM CHLORITE - 55 GAL. DRUM DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID)
108 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
J.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
109 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.5 ONLY PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
110 SODIUM FLUQORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
111 SODIUM FLUCRIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50
{Alternative Bid) LB. BAGS
112 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
113 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641
114 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250 GAL TOTE WET LB.
115 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS WET LB.
116 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 300-2,000 Gal. WET LB.
BULK
117 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE—15% | SMALL BULK
400~ 1,000 WET LB.
Gal. deliveries
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118 SODIUM HYPQCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 - 7,000 WET LB.
Gal. deliveries
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
119 | Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 gal. WET LB,
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries)
120 SODiUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55 GAL. DRUMS WET LB,
121 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% 275 GAL. WET.LB.
TOTE
122 SODIUM HYPQCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5 GAL. WET LB.
CONTAINER
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1 GAL. WET LB.
125
CONTAINER
126 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS GAL.
127 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
128 SODIUM THIOSULFATE (penta- 25 KG BAGS DRY KG.
hydrate}
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
130 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275 TOTE PER GAL.
(30%])
131 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB,
(V-937 OR EQUAL
132 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GALTOTE WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL)
133 ZINC ORTHOPHQOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL)
134 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GAL. DRUM WET LB.
135 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50 LB. PAIL DRY LB.
{CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL)
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS GAL.
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS
3180)
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137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL. GAL.
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE
3180)
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL)
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(5LI1-832 OR EQUAL)
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB,
(V-939 OR EQUAL)
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL)
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
{CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(5L1-935 OR £EQUAL)

144 Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee: Chemicals that
Tanker to support temporary on- bulk pumping
site storage for utility that needs and storage

to repair containment vessel, will support:

PROPOSAL FROM: .
Church & Dwight Co., Inc.

500 Charles Ewing Blvd.

Ewing, NJ 08628

Telephone: 484-509-7643 email:

timothy .yanuskiewicz@churchdwight.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium {(NEMVCC} and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or ail bids it shall be

deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.,

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the foliowing Addenda:

DocuSkgned by:
Signature: E it chalba

OCEEF1CFE5FT463..
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To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, |/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

IGNATURES

Sty ool

Authorizing Signature

Shitij Chabba President Specialty Products Division

Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

3/22/2023
Date

| certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name {(Mandatory): ©hurch & Dwight Co., Inc.

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable):

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be
assigned to the owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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CHURCH & DW'GHT CO, INC Corporate Headquarters:

Princeton South Corporate Park
500 Charles Ewing Boulevard
Ewing, New Jersey 08628

Main Phone: (609) 806-1200

March 22, 2023

Savas Danos

Panton MclLeod

Bidding Agent/Liaison

RE: Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium FY2023-24 Bid

Dear Mr. Danos,

[t is Church & Dwight Co., Inc.’s policy that Vice Presidents and Presidents are authorized to enter
agreements binding the company on matters falling within their areas of responsibility. Our Board of

Directors does not issue specific authorizations.

This will confirm that as President, Specialty Products Division, | am authorized by the corporation to
sign the agreement with the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium.

Sincerely,
DocuSigned by:
E(ufl dralrlsa,
OCBEF1CFESFT483..
Shitij Chabba

President, Specialty Products Division,

/mem

S

CONSUMER PRODUCTS - SPECIALTY PRODUCTS
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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM
FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024
OFFICIAL BID FORM
DATE:; 03/21/2023
VENDOR: | Conlon Progucts, inc.
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNITTYPE | UNITBID = PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL _ GAL.
{ACH) PAILS
y) ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. GAL.
{ACH) BULK —
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 ~ 5,000 GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | Gal. deliveries) —_—
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANS!
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 - 5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal, deliveries) —
Alternative Bid !
NSF 60/ANSI :
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER - ;
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50 LB. BAG } DRY LB.
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 - 1,000 ! GAL.
{40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries — |
8 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. BAGS _I CUFT.
—
9 AQUEQUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. . GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM GAL.
{PHOSPHORIC ACID)
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T

{ 11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15 GAL. DRUM T GAL
{PHOSPHORIC ACID} - |
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE SOLB.BAG  150.415/LB, [ DRY LB.
$20.75/50L8. Bag
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK  [$0.5275/L8B, 5 DRY LB.
$1,055/2,000LRB Sack
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 - 50 LBS
LBS BAGS -
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS —
BAGS
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 551BS LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue St by Fillion PAILS e
Associates)
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 LBS. _ ‘1 LBS.
{Accu-Tab St by Axiall LLC) PAILS ‘E
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery DRY LB.
{40/5C Ib. bags)
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK . DRY LB.
22 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 ~ 1,000 ——
Gal. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000 — 1
Gal. deliveries :
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55 GAL. DRUM N I wETLS.
25% SOLUTION ;
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL, TOTE . WETLS.
25 % SOLUTICN -
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 - 1,500 —_—
Gal. deliveries
27 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 -t WT LB.
Gal. deliveries
28 CHLORINE- DRY {HTH) 50 LB. PAILS DRY 1B.
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29 CHLORINE 1 TON ] LB i
CYLINDER
30 CHLORINE 150 LB. LB.
CYLINDER
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GAL TOTE WET LB.
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM WET LB.
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50L8 DRY L8.
BAGS/PALLET ;
343 COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG ' DRY LB.
FINE # 30
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK ORY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38%
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38%
{(Alternative Bid)
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK ; WET LB.
|
38 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55 GAL. DRUM ; WET LB.
39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID-24% | 270 gallon totes WET LB.
40 LIME (HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS } DRY L8,
2 ton min. |
41 LIME SLURRY BULK PER TON
42 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<15 PPM THC)
43 LIQUID DXYGEN BULK GAL.
{<40 PPM THC)
44 LIQUID POLYMER 275 GAL TOTE | GAL.
1
45 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL)
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROX!IDE 275 GAL TOTES GAL.
New ltem
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a7 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK CUFT.
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK Cu £T.
(alternate bid)
49 METHANOL (100%) 55 GAL DRUM GAL.
50 MURIATIC ACID-20" BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 - 3,000)
gallon delivered
51 MURIATIC ACID-20* BAUME 55 GAL DRUM GAL,
INHIBITED - NSF Certified
52 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520 LB. DRUM LB.
53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-galion jugs GAL
per box
54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK GAL.
{300-350 gal)
55 MURIATIC ACID ~ 20% 15 GAL. GAL.
CARBOY
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
{300-350 gal)
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 LB PAILS LB.
NEW ITEM (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL)
58 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL GAL.
{CARUS 4500) DRUMS
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
{AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) {300-500 GAL)
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON LB.
(50%-50% Biend) DRUM
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55 GALLON
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM LB.
{Aquamag or equal)
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON 8.
{30%-70% BLEND) DRUM
63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM LB,
(STERLING CP-33)
65 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30 GALLON GAL.
{SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS
8100}

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2023-2024)

4 of 10 pages



66 POLYMER {MANNICH) BULK f E LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 j
67 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275 GAL ) ‘ﬂl GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTE ; ;
68 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. T GAL. ‘T
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE
69 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. FRE TR
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTE
70 POLYMER 55 GAL [ GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM i
[
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM . WETLS.
75% SOLUTION f
72 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK i GAL
{HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) f
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GAL TOTE GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL)
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK ’ GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL)
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE ;
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK | | GAL
EQUAL) i ;
76 SMALL BULK | L WETLB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | 400 1,000 gal.
Deliveries I
77 LARGE BULK ! ' WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1,001 - 5,000 1
Gal. Deliveries ‘ i
78 BULK ! :
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% | 800 - 1,500 gal : ( WET LB
- shorter j P
wheelbase ,’
delivery i E
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE | { WET LB.
) !
i |
80 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | S5 GAL DRUM | WETLB.
81 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 15 GAL. PAIL } WET LB,
i
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM l LB.
{U.S. ONLY) | ,

NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages { FY 2023-2024)
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83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM L8.
(U.S. ONLY) \
84 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS Lg. |
{U.S. ONLY)
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55 LB. DRUM LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid)
86 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330 LB. DRUM LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)
87 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid)
88 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
{AWWA B405 — LATEST)
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF §0)
90 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
{AWWA/NSF 60} Full Truckload
Release
91 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
{WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload
Release
92 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
{WASTEWATER) Per Pallet
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+
94 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK WET LB,
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL
95 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL. DRUM i WET LB.
38% SOLUTION [
96 SODIUM 50 LBS BAGS { DRY 18.
METABISULFITE {GRANULAR} 2 pallet deliv. /
97 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
98 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE
99 SODIJM CARBONATE BULK DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE
100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
|
101 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION - .S, ONLY !
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2023-2024) 6 of 10 pages



102 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM | WETLB.
25% SOLUTION ~ U.S. ONLY ;
103 SODIUM CHLORITE ~ 25% BULK ! WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid)
104 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM . WIETLB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid}
|
105 SODIUM CHLORITE - BULK | WETLB.
25% SOLUTION - non-AWWA for
wastewater use only :
106 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM ; WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for
wastewater use only j s
107 SODIUM CHLORITE —- 55 GAL. DRUM | DRY LB.
{SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) E
108 SOBIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL ! DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG
PALLETS OF 50 j
LB. BAGS !
109 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG 1 DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
110 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
{Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS :
111 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG i DRY (B.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50
{Alternative Bid) {B. BAGS
112 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
113 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641
114 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250 GAL TOTE WET LB,
115 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS WET L8.
116 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 300-2,000 Gal. WET LB.
BULK .
117 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% SMALL BULK {
400 - 1,000 » i WET LB.
Gal. deliveries ' E
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137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL. [ GAL.
{SHANNGN SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE
3180)
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL ; GAL
{CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) §
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WETLB.
(5LI-932 OR EQUAL)
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK \ | WETLB.
{Vv-939 OR EQUAL)
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK \ WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL)
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK \ WETLB.
{CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) j
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK E | WETLB.
{5L1-939 OR EQUAL)

144 Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee: i Chemicals that
Tanker to support temporary on- &; bulk pumping
site storage for utility that needs and storage

to repair containment vessel. . will support:
PROPOSAL FROM: Conlon Products, Inc.
70 Shepard Strest Lawrence, Ma. 01843
Telephone: 978-682-8482 email: MConlon@ConlonProducts.net

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or ali bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda:

Signature:
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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2023-2024

OFFICIAL BID FORM
DATE: 03/17/2023
VENDOR: | George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNITTYPE | UNITBID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15 GAL GAL
(ACH) PAILS $14.95 ./
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000 GAL. . GAL.
(ACH) BULK No Bid
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 - 5,000 GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | Gal. deliveries) No Bid
Acid Preparation
N5F 60/ANSI
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION {500 — 5,000 GALLON
Other Prep Method Gal. deliveries) Ne Bid
Alternative Bid
NSF 60/ANSI
5 AMMONIA GAS 150 LB. ) LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
AMMONIUM SULFATE SOLB. BAG DRY LB.
6 No Bid
7 AMMONIUM SULFATE 500 - 1,000 . GAL,
(40% SOLUTION) Gal. deliveries No Bid
8 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. BAGS , CU.FT.
No Bid
9 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000 Gal. . GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME {29%) deliveries No Bid
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30 GAL. DRUM 1 e
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) $16.2826
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2023-2024) 1 of 10 pages

Min 9 deldrums = 1
patlet. Less issrex
with shipping

Bidding en CP-36.
Min 2 drums per
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11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15 GAL. DRUM ) GAL. Bidding on CP-36. Min
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) $13.8425 P drumsper delivery
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50 1B. BAG . DRY LB.
No Bid
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK . DRY LB.
No Bid
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 - 50 LBS
LBS BAGS $3.2385
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS $4.0359 j
BAGS '
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE E51BS LBS
{Accu-Tab Blue S by Filllon PAILS No Bid
Associates)
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55 L8s. / LBS.
(Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC) PAILS $3.2385
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery . DRY LB.
{40/50 Ib. bags) No Bid
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK . LB.
No Bid
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK . TON
No Bid
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK No Bid DRY LB.
22 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALL BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500-1,000 No Bid
Gal. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 - 5,000 No Bid
Gal. deliveries
24 CAUSTIC S0DA - 55 GAL. DRUM . WETLB,
25% SOLUTION No Bid
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275 GAL. TOTE ) WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION No Bid
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500 - 1,500 No Bid
Gal, deliveries
27 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 No Bid WTLB.
Gal. deliveries
28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50 LB. PAILS ) DRY LB.
No Bid
NEMVCC Official Bid Form and Signature Pages ( FY 2023-2024) 2 of 10 pages
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29 CHLORINE 1TON , LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
CHLORINE 150 LB. B,
30 CYLINDER No Bid
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250 GAL TOTE A WET LB,
$1.2893 -/
CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GAL.DRUM T WETLB.
32 $1.4064 ./
CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50 LB — DRYLB.
33 BAGS/PALLET $24444 1S
34a COPPER SULFATE 50 LB. BAG _ DRY LB.
FINE # 30 No Bid
34b COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50 LB. BAG No Bid DRY LB,
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK _ DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38% No Bid
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB,
FOREIGN: 32%-38% No Bid
(Alternative Bid)
37 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK No Bid WET LB.
0 Bl
38 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% | 55 GAL. DRUM _ WET LB.
No Bid
39 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% | 270 galfon totes o Bld WETLB.
LIME (HYDRATED) 50 LB BAGS DRY LB.
40 2 ton min. No Bid
a1 LIME SLURRY BULK No Bid PER TON
i
42 (IQUID OXYGEN BULK _ GAL.
(<15 PPM THC) No Bid
43 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK _ GAL.
(<40 PPM THC) No Bid |
LIQUID POLYMER 275 GAL TOTE GAL.
44 s1042
45 | LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE {CARUS BULK _ WET LB,
8500 OR EQUAL) No Bid
46 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 375 GAL TOTES GAL
New ftem No Bid
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a7 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK _ CUFT.
No Bid
48 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK , CUFT.
(alternate bid) No Bid
49 METHANOL (100%) 55 GAL DRUM _ GAL.
No Bid
50 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 — 3,000) No Bid
gallon delivered
51 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55 GAL DRUM , GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified No Bid
52 MURIATICACID- 20° BAUME | 520 LB. DRUM , LB.
No Bid
53 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | 4, 1-gallon jugs , GAL
per hox No Bid
54 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK , GAL.
{300-350 gal) No Bid
55 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15 GAL. _ GAL,
CARBOY No Bid
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME | PUMPTED TOTE , GAL.
{300-350 gal) No Bid
57 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50 LB PAILS o LB, Bidding CP-33D.
New e (CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) $3.7570% - Min palles quandites
ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL ' GAL. Bidding on CP-25. Min
58 (CARUS 4500) DRUMS $30.8958 +/ 4 drums per delivery
59 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK _ (8.
{AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) {300-500 GAL) No Bid
60 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON J LB. Bidding on CP.720. M
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM $1.5030 | / 4 s pr ety
61 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55 GALLON T
{50%-50% Blend) DRUM $1.3781 iB. Mir d drnms per delivery
{Aquamag or equal)
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30 GALLON (8. idting o CP722 i
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM $1.6311. 4 ol
63 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55 GALLON A LB. Bidding on CP-711L.
{10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM $1.2067 i 4 s per deivery
64 POLYPHOSPHATE 340 LBS DRUM » 8. Bidding an CP-33. Min
(STERLING CP-33) $1.6492 e pr dliery
65 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30 GALLON , GAL. P
{(SHANNON SLi 5225 OR CARUS DRUMS $12.8894 Min 2 dritms per detfvery
8100)
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66 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK , L.
S$NF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 No Bid
67 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275 GAL. _ GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTE No Bid
68 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 775 GAL. _ GAL,
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTE No Bid
69 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. _ GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 . TOTE No Bid
70 POLYMER 55 GAL GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM No Bid
71 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15 GAL. DRUM T WETLB. Bidding o CP.78, Max
75% SOLUTION ' $1.9722 9 drwins pr detivery
27 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK _ GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
73 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275 GAL TOTE ‘ GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) No Bid
74 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL,
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL) No Bid
75 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK No Bid GAL.
EQUAL)
76 SMALL BULK WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | 400 —1,000 gal. No Bid
Deliveries
77 LARGE BULK WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE —45% | 1,001~ 5,000 No Bid
Gal. Deliveries
78 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE -45% | 800 — 1,500 gal WET LB
- shorter No Bid
wheelbase
delivery
79 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTE , WET LB.
No Bid
20 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% | 55 GAL. DRUM , WET LB.
No Bid
81 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE —45% | 15 GAL. PAIL _ WET LB.
No Bid
82 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 55 LB. DRUM _ 8.
{U.S. ONLY) No Bid
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83 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 330 LB. DRUM , LE.
{U.S. ONLY} No Bid
24 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB, PAILS _ LB.
(U.S. ONLY) No Bid
85 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 55 LB. DRUM 7 LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) - $2.9688
26 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE | 330 LB. DRUM ' LB.
{FOREIGN - Alternative Bid} $2.9974 \/
87 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 5 LB. PAILS , LE.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) No Bid
a8 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK _ WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST} No Bid
89 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK , DRY LB,
(AWWA/NSF 60) No Bid
90 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckioad No Bid
Release
91 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG . DRY LB,
(WASTEWATER } Full Truckload No Bid
Release
92 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LBS. BAG ‘ DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet No Bid
93 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK , WET LB.
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL+ No Bid
94 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK _ WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL No Bid
g5 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55 GAL DRUM , WET LB.
38% SOLUTION No Bid
96 SODIUM 50 LBS BAGS . DRY LB.
METABISULFITE {GRANULAR) 2 pallet defiv. No Bid
97 SODIUM CARBONATE 50 LB. BAG , DRY LE.
SODA ASH- DENSE No Bid
98 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS : DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE No Bid
99 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK , DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE No Bid
SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 LB. BAG DRY LB.
100 No Bid
101 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK _ WET LB.
259 SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY No Bid
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102 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM ‘ WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.5. ONLY No Bid
103 SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK , WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) No Bid
104 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55 GAL DRUM WET LB,
FOREIGN (alternate bid) No Bid
105 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK WET LB,
25% SOLUTION — non-AWWA for No Bid
wastewater use only
106 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55 GAL DRUM WET LB.
255 SOLUTION — non-AWWA for No Bid
wastewater use only
107 SODIUM CHLORITE ~ 55 GAL. DRUM _ DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID} No Bid
108 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG ,
PALLETS OF 50 No Bid
LB. BAGS
109 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50 )
LB. BAGS No Bid
110 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG No Bid
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50
LB. BAGS
111 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN | PALLETS OF 50 No Bid
{Alternative Bid) LB. BAGS
112 | SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG $2.8333¢ / DRY LB, o190 s por et
113 Sodlum Hexametaphosphate | 55 GAL DRUM A WETLB. | autiing on CP734 Min
PRISTINE SK-7641 $1.5563  drims pr delivery
114 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250 GAL TOTE No Bid WET LB.
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 5 GAL CARBOYS WET LB.
115 No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 Gal. WET LB.
116 BULK No Bid
117 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% SMALL BULK
400 - 1,000 No Bid WET LB,
Gal, deliveries
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118 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 - 7,000 No Bid WET LB.
Gal. deliveries
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK No Bid
119 | (certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 gal. o B WET LB.
and Delivery {Alternative Bid) deliveries)
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% | 55 GAL. DRUMS ‘ WET LS.
Mo Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% 275 GAL. WET.LB.
121 T No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30 GAL. WET LB.
122 No Bid
CONTAINER
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15 GAL. , WET LB.
CONTAINER No Bid
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5 GAL. WET LB,
124 No Bid
CONTAINER
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1 GAL. , WET LB.
No Bid :
CONTAINER _‘
126 SODIUM PERMANGANATE 55 GAL DRUMS 61211 J GAL.
12.
127 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50 LB. BAG _ DRY LB.
No Bid
SODIUM THIOSULFATE {penta- 25 KG BAGS DRY KG.
128 (p No Bid
hydrate)
R L
129 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK No Bid PER TON
THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275 TOTE PER GAL.
130 58.35
(30%)
131 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50 LB. BAG 7 DRY LB. Bldting on CP-787D. Min
(v-937 OR EQUAL $2.5357 7 | 28 e
132 7INC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL TOTE 1 WET.LB. Bidding on CP-1236
{V-970 OR EQUAL) $1.4515- M 1 tte per delivery
133 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK ) WET LB.
(V-670 OR EQUAL) No Bid
L DR . o
134 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55 GA UumM $1.0756 \/ WETLB Mﬁmm:‘:jﬁlﬁm
135 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50 LB. PAIL o DRY LB. Biding on CPI67D.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) $2.5357 My 3,000 1 per deltoery
136 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30 GAL. DRUMS ¥ eaL Bidding on
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS $28.8241 CP-1236,
3180)
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137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275 GAL. { ; GAL. sidding on CP-1236
{SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTE $18.1784 Min 2 totes per detivery
3180)
138 ZINC ORTHCPHOSPHATE 15-GAL PAIL i GAL Bidding on CP-123L
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) $22.7789 A 3 s pe ey
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK o WET LB. Bliding on CP-7855. Min
(SLI-932 OR EQUAL) $0.5868 3400 e per deery
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK . WET LB.
(V-939 OR EQUAL) No Bid
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK .
141 ' NoBid | VTP
{UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) V
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK o WET LB. Bidiing on CASSAD. Min
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL) $2.4214 - 2000t po delvry
143 ZINC CRTHOPHOSPHATE BULK . WETLB.
{SLI-939 OR EQUAL) No Bid
144 Emergency Pumping and Storage Daily Fee! Chemicals that
Tanker to support temporary on- : bulk pumping
. i No Bid
site storage for utility that needs and storage
to repair containment vessel. will support:
PROPOSAL FROM:
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
3015 State Road
Croydon, PA 19021
Telephone:  215-785-3000 email: bidadministration@coynechemical.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC} and our Host Community
resetve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: No Addenda Received

Signature:

inance & Operations/Asst. Secretary
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To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, {/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES

Authorizing Signature

Meridith C. Haskin, Treasurer/VP Finance & Operations/Asst. Secretary
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

03/17/2023
Date

{ certify under the penalty of periury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandator&:\mg@/7
e —

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): Meridith C. Haskin, Treasurer/VP Finance & Operations/Asst. Secratary

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must make arrangements to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be
assigned to the owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or
guarantees as part of the awarding procedure.
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Amendment Letter

Pg. 8 of 21, #17 Removal: “Ali Used Totes or other contalners, upon request of
the Consortium Member, will be removed once a reorder s shipped to the
Consortium Member.”

The GEORGE 5. COYNE CHEMICAL CO., INC. respectfully takes exception
to the above statement. We wili provide the names of tote/drum
recycling companies upon award. George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
does not remove empty totes or drums. This applies to the Phosphates
only.

Pg. 6 of 21, #9 Time of Payment: “The Communities/Utilitles shall make
payment within forty-five (45) days after delivery of any purchase made
under the terms of this Confract, acceptance, and proper involce of same is
submitted and approved by the proper authority In each community.”

The GEORGE $. COYNE CHEMICAL CO., INC. respectfully takes exception
to the above statement regarding payment within 45 days after receipt of
invoice. The GEORGE §. COYNE CHEMICAL CO., INC. payment terms are
net 30 days.

The GEORGE §. COYNE CHEMICAL CO., INC. is bidding with the understanding
that our delivery terms are 7-10 business days ARO for packaged product
delivery and 10-14 business days ARO for bulk product delivery. We take
exception to any other staled delivery terms expressed within the bidding

documentation.
GEORGE 5. COYNE CHEMICAL CO., INC
,7 4 }f X{,Z_,
ﬂhn V. Drze%deki, Director of Sales
George S. Coyne Chemical Company, inc. 3015 State Road, Croydon PA 19021

PHONE 215-785-3000 Fax 215-785-1585 orpERs orders@coynechemical.com
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