NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2024-25

OFFICIAL BID FORM

DATE: 03/06/24
VENDOR: | Shannon Chemical Corporation
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) PAILS no bid
2 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000-GAL. na bid GAL.
(ACH) BULK
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK .
SOLUTION (500 5,000 | O bid GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | GAL. deliveries)
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANSI
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 — 5,000 no bid GALLON
Other Prep Method GAL. deliveries)
Alternative Bid
NSF 60/ANSI
5 AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. LB.
CYLINDER  |no bid
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS no bid
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 -1,000 GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) GAL. deliveries |no bid
8 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. CU.FT.
BAGS no ibd
9 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000-GAL. GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries | no bid )
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30-GAL. v GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM $11.47/gallon
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4

GAL. deliveries

11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15-GAL. J GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM $13.44/gallon
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS no bid
13 CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
no bid
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 — 50 LBS
LBS. BAGS no bid
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS | no bid
BAGS
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. no bid LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue Sl by Fillion PAILS
Associates)
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. LBS.
(Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC) PAILS no bid
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery no bid DRY LB.
(40/50 LBS.
bags) nob
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK LB.
no bid
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
no bid
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK . DRY LB.
no bid
22 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALLBULK | ho bid WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 - 1,000
GAL. deliveries
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK | no bid WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 -5,000
GAL. deliveries
24 CAUSTIC SODA - 55-GAL. WET LB.
25% SOLUTION DRUM no bid
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275-GAL. WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION TOTES no bid
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK . WET LB.
50% SOLUTION 500-1,500 | Mo bid
GAL. deliveries
27 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK | no bid
50% SOLUTION 1,501 - 6,000 WT LB.
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28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50-LBS. DRY LB.
PAILS no bid
29 CHLORINE 1 TON ; LB.
CYLINDER ho bid
30 CHLORINE 150-LBS. , LB.
CYLINDER | Mo bid
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250-GAL. ‘ WET LB.
TOTES $1.18/# /
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55-GAL. /| WET LB.
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET | no bid
34 COPPER SULFATE 50-LBS. _ DRY LB.
FINE # 30 BAGS no bid
35 COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50-LBS. no bid DRY LB.
BAGS
36 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK bid DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38% no i
37 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38% no bid
(Alternative Bid)
NEW ITEM | GRANULAR ACTIVATED CARBON BULK DRY. LB.
-38 no bid
NEW ITEM GRANULAR ACTIVATED BULK 16 bid DRY. LB.
-39 CARBON-
REGENERATED
HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK WET LB.
40 ° no bid
41 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM no bid
42 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 270-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES no bid
43 LIME (HYDRATED) 50-LBS. BAGS | 5 bid DRY LB.
2-ton min.
L
44 LIME SLURRY BULK b PER TON
45 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK no bid GAL.
(<15 PPM THC)
46 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK GAL.
(<40 PPM THC) | no bid
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47 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL.
TOTES no bid
48 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK \/ WET LB.
8500 OR EQUAL) $1.12/#
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275-GAL. GAL.
TOTES no bid
50 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK . CU FT.
no bid
51 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK CU FT.
(alternate bid) no bid
52 METHANOL (100%) 55-GAL. . GAL.
DRUM no bid
53 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK GAL.
(1,000 - 3,000) |no bid
GAL. delivered
54 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55-GAL. GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM no bid
55 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520-LBS. ne bid LB.
DRUM
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-GAL. jugs GAL
per box no bid
57 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK . GAL.
(300-350 GAL.) | no bid
58 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15-GAL. GAL.
CARBOY no bid
59 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE . GAL.
no bid
(300-350 GAL.)
60 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50-LBS. \/ LB.
(CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) PAILS $2.67/#
61 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. / GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUM $13.07/gallon’
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK / LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL.) | $1.38/#
63 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. \/ LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM $1.17/#
64 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. /
(50%—50% Blend) DRUM $117/# LB.
(Aquamag or equal) /
65 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. J LB.
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM $1.171#
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66 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55-GAL. LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM $1.17/4 Y/
67 POLYPHOSPHATE 340-LBS. LB.
(STERLING CP-33) DRUM A rs ‘/
68 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30-GAL. / GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUM V
8100) $12.09/gallon
69 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 no bid
70 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275-GAL. no bid GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTES
71 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. _ GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTES no bid
72 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTES no bid
73 POLYMER 55-GAL. no.bid GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM
74 POLYMER 275-GAL. o bid GAL
SNF NE-1922 TOTES
75 POLYMER 55- GAL. _ GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC GAC no bid
C6287
76 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL
BASF ZETEG 8848FS OR TOTES no bid .
PRAESTOL K290 FLY /
77 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15-GAL. \/ WET LB.
75% SOLUTION DRUM $1.17/#
78 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) no bid
79 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275-GAL . no bid GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) TOTES
30 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK _ GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL) no bid
81 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE no bid
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK GAL.
EQUAL)
82 SMALLBULK | . WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 400 -1,000
GAL.
Deliveries
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33 LARGE BULK | no bid WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE —45% | 1,001 — 5,000
GAL. Deliveries
84 BULE no bid
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 — 1,500 WET LB
GAL.- shorter
wheelbase
delivery
85 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES no bid WET LB.
S6 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55-GAL. . WET LB.
DRUM no bid
]7 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 15-GAL. _ WET LB.
PAILS no bid
88 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. _ LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM no bid
89 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. no bid LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM /
90 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. / ) LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) DRUM $2.57/% /
91 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. $2.57/# J LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) DRUM
92 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST) no bid
93 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK o bid DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60)
94 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG _ DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload | N0 bid
Release
95 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload |no bid
Release
96 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG |16 bid DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet
97 SODIUM BISULFITE- BULK _ WET LB.
no bid
38% SOLUTION 1,000 GAL.+
98 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK _ WET LB.
38% SOLUTION <800GAL.  |no bid
99 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55-GAL. WET LB.
38% SOLUTION DRUM no bid
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100 SODIUM 50-LBS. BAGS | no bid DRY LB.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet
delivery.
101 SODIUM CARBONATE 50-LBS. 16 bid DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE BAGS
102 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS - DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE Ho Dl
103 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK _ DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE no bid
104 SODIUM CHLORIDE 50 -LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS no bid
105 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY no bid
106 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55-GAL. no bid WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY DRUM
107 SODIUM CHLORITE - 25% BULK . WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) no bid
108 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM no bid
109 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for no bid
Wastewater Use Only
110 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. 1o bid WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for DRUM
Wastewater Use Only
111 SODIUM CHLORITE — 55-GAL. _ DRY LB.
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) DRUM no bid
112 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG no bid
PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
113 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS no bid
114 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL | no bid DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
115 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50- |no bid
(Alternative Bid) LBS. BAGS
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116 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. / DRY LB.
BAGS 217~
117 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55-GAL. $1.17/# \/ WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641 DRUM
118 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250-GAL. WET LB.
TOTES no bid
- 0, -
119 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 5-GAL. no bid WET LB.
CARBOYS
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 GAL. WET LB.
BULK no bid
121 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% SMALL BULK
400 - 1,000 no bid WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK
1,001 -7,000 |no bid WET LB.
GAL. deliveries
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK
Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 GAL. no bid
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries) WET LB.
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUMS no bid
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% 275-GAL. WET.LB.
TOTES no bid
= 0 -
126 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30-GAL. 1o Bid WET LB.
CONTAINER
127 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15-GAL. ) WET LB.
CONTAINER | MO bid
128 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5-GAL. no bid WET LB.
CONTAINER
129 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1-GAL. r: (i WET LB.
CONTAINER
A
—130 |  SODIUWPERMANGANATE 55-GAL, GAL. Ot Lg\
DRUM $11.77/gallon s’ <
131 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50-LBS. DRY LB. H
BAGS no bid
132 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2-KG. . DRY KG.
(penta-hydrate) BAGS no bid
NEW ITEM SODIUM THIOSULFATE 5- GAL. GAL
-133 (30% SOLUTION) DRUM fes [
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134 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK PER TON
no bid
135 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275-GAL. . PER GAL.
(30%) TOTES no bid |
136 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. j DRY LB.
(V-937 OR EQUAL BAGS $3.84/#
137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. $1.07/4 J WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES /
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK $1.57/# ) / WETLB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL)
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. /" WETLB.
DRUM $1.278
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. \// DRY LB.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS $2.37/#
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. /' GAL
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS DRUM $16.47/gallon /
3180) e
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. $16.27/gallon / GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES
3180) M
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL. / GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) PAILS $39.99/gallon~
144 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(SLI-932 OR EQUAL) $0.543# |/
ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
145 (V-939 OR EQUAL) $0.9734 ~/
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK $1.11/# \/ WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) |
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK $2.07/4 J WET LB.
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)
148 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK J  GALLON
(CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL) $11.27/gallon -
149 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK /' WETLB.
(SLI-939 OR EQUAL) s1.07 V|
150 Emergency Pumping and Daily Fee: n/a Chemicals that
Storage Tanker to support bulk pumping
temporary on-site storage for and storage
utility that needs to repair will support:
containment vessel.
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PROPOSAL FROM:
Shannon Chemical Corporation

P.O. Box 376

Malvern, PA 19355

Telephone:  610-363-9090 email: dcflynn@shannonchem.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda:

Signature: Daniel C. Flynn, V.P.-Operations M)“

To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, I/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES

D%

Authorizing Signature

Daniel C. Flynn, V.P.-Operations
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

03/06/24
Date

1%

K v{h Fiynn, Secretary

/
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I certify under the penalty of perjury that I, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory): Shannon Chemical Corporation

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): Daniel C. Flynn Dmh

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this cer/tjfication clause is signed
by the applicant. )

p
All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the
owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or guarantees as part
of the awarding procedure.
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NORTHEAST/MERRIMACK VALLEY CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM

FISCAL YEAR 2024-25

OFFICIAL BID FORM - |

DATE: 3/19/2024
VENDOR: Univar Solutions USA, LLC.
200 Dean Sievers Place, Morrisville, PA 19067
NOTE: BID PRICES MUST BE PER UNIT SPECIFIED ON THIS BID FORM
ITEM CHEMICAL UNIT TYPE UNIT BID PER
NO.
1 ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 15-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) PAILS No Bid
pJ ALUMINUM CHLOROHYDRATE 1,000-GAL. GAL.
(ACH) BULK No Bid
3 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 - 5,000 No Bid GALLON
Unrefined Bauxite Ore & Sulfuric | GAL. deliveries) o bl
Acid Preparation
NSF 60/ANSI
4 ALUMINUM SULFATE - 50% BULK
SOLUTION (500 — 5,000 No Bid GALLON
Other Prep Method GAL. deliveries)
Alternative Bid
NSF 60/ANSI i
5 AMMONIA GAS 150-LBS. / LB.
CYLINDER $4.89
6 AMMONIUM SULFATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS $0.95
7 AMMONIIUM SULFATE 500 -1,000 GAL.
(40% SOLUTION) GAL. deliveries | No Bid
8 ANTHRACITE 60+ LBS. CU.FT.
BAGS No Bid /
9 AQUEOUS AMMONIA 1,000-GAL. \// GAL.
MUST BE 26° BAUME (29%) deliveries $2.05
10 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 30-GAL. GAL.
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM No Bid
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11 CALCIQUEST ORTHO 15-GAL. ; GAL.
No Bid
(PHOSPHORIC ACID) DRUM
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE 50-LBS. $0.4156 / DRY LB.
BAGS )
CALCIUIM CHLORIDE SUPERSACK DRY LB.
13 $0.4150 \//
14 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE PALLET/50 - 50 $3.28 LBS
LBS. BAGS )
15 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE LESS THAN LBS
PALLET - 50 LBS $4.25 \//
BAGS
16 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. _ LBS
(Accu-Tab Blue SI by Fillion PAILS No Bid
Associates)
17 CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 55-LBS. _ LBS.
(Accu-Tab SI by Axiall LLC) PAILS No Bid
18 CALCIUM NITRATE Per ton delivery No Bid DRY LB.
(40/50 LBS.
bags)
19 CARBON DIOXIDE BULK No Bid LB.
20 CARBON POWDERED BULK TON
No Bid
21 CARBON POWDERED SUPERSACK _ DRY LB.
No Bid /
22 CAUSTIC SODA - SMALLBULK | 0 1487 L// WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 500 — 1,000
GAL. deliveries /
23 CAUSTIC SODA - LARGE BULK $0.112 / WET LB.
25% SOLUTION 1,001 — 5,000 i
GAL. deliveries /
- - y
24 CAUSTIC SODA 55-GAL. $0.2139 A WET LB.
25% SOLUTION DRUM . ,
25 CAUSTIC SODA - 275-GAL. / WET LB.
25 % SOLUTION TOTES $0.2056
26 CAUSTIC SODA- SMALL BULK 1 ~ WETLB.
50% SOLUTION 500 - 1,500 $0.1908 _/
GAL. deliveries
27 CAUSTIC SODA — LARGE BULK / '
50% SOLUTION 1,501-6,000 | $0.1708 (A WT LB.
GAL. deliveries
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28 CHLORINE- DRY (HTH) 50-LBS. _ DRY LB.
PAILS No Bid
29 CHLORINE 1 TON LB.
CYLINDER No Bid
30 CHLORINE 150-LBS. LB.
CYLINDER No Bid /
31 CITRIC ACID 50% 250-GAL. J WET LB.
TOTES $0.8235
32 CITRIC ACID 50% 55-GAL. $0.8823 J WET LB.
DRUM :
33 CITRIC ACID 50% POWDER 50-LBS. $1.23 / DRY LB.
BAGS/PALLET /
34 COPPER SULFATE 50-LBS. $288 /| | DRYLB.
FINE # 30 BAGS '
35 COPPER SULFATE - LARGE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
BAGS No Bid
35 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 32%-38% No Bid
37 FERRIC CHLORIDE - BULK , DRY.LB.
FOREIGN: 32%-38% No Bid
(Alternative Bid)
NEW ITEM | GRANULAR ACTIVATED CARBON BULK DRY. LB.
NEW ITEM GRANULAR ACTIVATED BULK _ DRY. LB.
-39 CARBON- No Bid
REGENERATED /
- 0,
40 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% BULK $0.3150 \// WET LB.
41 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 55-GAL. $0.50 J WET LB.
DRUM
HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID- 24% 270-GAL. . WET LB.
42 ° No Bid
TOTES
NEW ITEM | HYDROGEN PEROXIDE —27% BULK GALS.
a42-A No Bid
43 LIME (HYDRATED) 50-LBS. BAGS $0.3899 _/ DRYLB.
2-ton min.
44 LIME SLURRY BULK No Bid PER TON
45 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK _ GAL.
(<15 PPM THC) | NoBid
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46 LIQUID OXYGEN BULK . GAL.
(<0 PPM THC) | No Bid
47 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. . GAL.
TOTES No Bid
48 LIQUID POLYPHOSPHATE (CARUS BULK . WET LB.
No Bid /
8500 OR EQUAL) /
49 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 275-GAL. GAL.
TOTES 756 /|
50 MANGANESE GREENSAND BULK No Bid CU FT.
51 MANGANESE GREENSAND PLUS BULK ) CU FT.
(alternate bid) No Bid
52 METHANOL (100%) 55-GAL. . GAL.
DRUM No Bid
53 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME BULK No Bid GAL.
(1,000 - 3,000)
GAL. delivered j
54 MURIATIC ACID-20° BAUME 55-GAL. $4.93 / , GAL.
INHIBITED - NSF Certified DRUM /
55 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 520-LBS. $4.93 / “+8B. Gal
DRUM
56 MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME 4, 1-GAL. jugs No Bid GAL
per box 3
57 MURIATIC ACID - 15% TOTE BULK $4.09 / GAL.
(300-350 GAL.) /
58 MURIATIC ACID — 20% 15-GAL. GAL.
CARBOY $18.74 ./
MURIATIC ACID- 20° BAUME PUMPTED TOTE GAL.
59 No Bid
(300-350 GAL.)
60 POLY/ORTHO PHOSPHATE 50-LBS. LB.
(CARUS 8650 OR EQUAL) PAILS No Bid
61 ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. GAL.
(CARUS 4500) DRUM No Bid
62 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE BULK LB.
(AQUAMAG OR EQUAL) (300-500 GAL) | No Bid
63 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. LB.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM No Bid
64 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 55-GAL.
(50%-50% Blend) DRUM No Bid LB.
(Aquamag or equal)
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65 ORTHO-POLYPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. . LB.
No Bid
(30%-70% BLEND) DRUM
66 ORTHO-PHOSPHATE 55-GAL. _ LB.
(10%-90% ORTHO/POLY BLEND DRUM No Bid
67 POLYPHOSPHATE 340-LBS. No Bid LB.
(STERLING CP-33) DRUM
68 PHOSPHATE (LIQUID) 30-GAL. _ GAL.
(SHANNON SLI 5225 OR CARUS DRUM No Bid
8100)
69 POLYMER (MANNICH) BULK No Bid LB.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C-321 o Bl
70 POLYMER (ANIONIC) 275-GAL. _ GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1920 TOTES No Bid
71 POLYMER (CATIONIC) 275 GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE NE-1921 TOTES No Bid
72 POYMER (CATIONIC) 275-GAL. GAL.
SNF POYDYNE NE-1922 TOTES No Bid
73 POLYMER 55-GAL. GAL
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC C6287 DRUM No Bid
74 POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL
SNF NE-1922 TOTES No Bid
75 POLYMER 55- GAL. GAL.
SNF POLYDYNE CLARIFLOC GAC No Bid
C6287
76 LIQUID POLYMER 275-GAL. GAL
BASF ZETEG 8848FS OR TOTES No Bid
PRAESTOL K290 FLY
77 PHOSPHORIC ACID 15-GAL. /' WETLB.
75% SOLUTION DRUM $1.1450
78 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK No Bid GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) 0 Bl
79 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE 275-GAL . GAL
(HOLLAND PCH 180 or EQUAL) TOTES No Bid
80 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE BULK _ GAL.
(HOLLAND EPIC 525 or EQUAL) No Bid
81 POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE _
(HOLLAND PCH 182 OR BULK No Bid . GAL
EQUAL) /
82 SMALL BULK $0.4025 / WET LB.
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% A
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400 -1,000

GAL. /
Deliveries /
33 LARGE BULK | $0.3675 WET LB
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE —45% | 1,001 — 5,000
GAL. Deliveries
84 BULK
POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE - 45% 800 — 1,500 No Bid WET LB
GAL.- shorter
wheelbase y
delivery /
85 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% TOTES 506453 _/  WETLB.
36 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE- 45% 55-GAL. $0.6272 / ~ WET LB,
DRUM A
— 0, o
]7 POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE — 45% 1§AGIC\SL. $0.9350 WET LB.
88 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. 4.0 : LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM ¥ .
89 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. $4.00 / LB.
(U.S. ONLY) DRUM ' :
90 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 55-LBS. _ LB.
(FOREIGN- Alternative Bid) DRUM No Bid
91 POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 330-LBS. _ LB.
(FOREIGN - Alternative Bid) DRUM No Bid
92 SODIUM ALUMINATE- 38% BULK _ WET LB.
(AWWA B405 — LATEST) No Bid
93 SODIUM BICARBONATE BULK . DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) No Bid y
94 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG / DRY LB.
(AWWA/NSF 60) Full Truckload | $0.5565
Release /
95 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG / DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER ) Full Truckload | 90-5565
Release /
96 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50-LBS. BAG , / DRY LB.
(WASTEWATER) Per Pallet $0.5565 /
- /' WETLB
97 SODIUM BISULFITE BULK .
38% SOLUTION 1,000GAL+ | $0.2791 /|
98 SODIUM BISULFITE- MINI-BULK 03602 4 WET LB.
38% SOLUTION < 800 GAL. $0.3
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99 SODIUM BISULFITE- 55-GAL. $0.3776 J WET LB.
38% SOLUTION DRUM :
100 SODIUM 50-LBS. BAGS $0.7209 / DRY LB.
METABISULFITE (GRANULAR) 2 pallet : 4
delivery.
y
101 SODIUM CARBONATE 50-LBS. DRY LB.
SODA ASH- DENSE BAGS $0.4200 ~/
102 SODIUM CARBONATE SUPER SACKS $04333 DRY LB.
SODA ASH -DENSE ’
103 SODIUM CARBONATE BULK 3015 /  DRYLB.
SODA ASH- DENSE $0. v /
104 SODIUM CHLORIDE sgA-LGBSs. $0.3950 \// DRY LB.
105 SODIUM CHLORITE — BULK No Bid WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY
106 SODIUM CHLORITE- 55-GAL. No Bid WET LB.
25% SOLUTION — U.S. ONLY DRUM 0 Bl
107 SODIUM CHLORITE — 25% BULK _ WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) No Bid
108 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. No Bid WET LB.
FOREIGN (alternate bid) DRUM
109 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% BULK No Bid WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for 0.8l
Wastewater Use Only
110 SODIUM CHLORITE- 25% 55-GAL. No Bid WET LB.
SOLUTIONS-non AWWA for DRUM
Wastewater Use Only
111 SODIUM CHLORITE - 55-GAL. No Bid DRY LB
(SAFE-T-CHLOR SOLID) DRUM o Bi
112 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL 3 DRY LB.
U.S. ONLY 40 BAG ,, (ng\
PALLETS OF 50- (& -
LBS. BAGS (0(2«\‘)*/\
113 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG $ DRY LB.
U.S ONLY PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS :
/ @\
114 SODIUM FLUORIDE LESS THAN FULL $1.55 / DRY LB.
FOREIGN 40 BAG : A
(Alternative Bid) PALLETS OF 50-
LBS. BAGS
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115 SODIUM FLUORIDE FULL 40 BAG DRY LB.
FOREIGN PALLETS OF 50- $1.27 /
(Alternative Bid) LBS. BAGS
116 SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. No Bid DRY LB.
BAGS e
117 Sodium Hexametaphosphate 55-GAL. No Bid / WET LB.
PRISTINE SK-7641 DRUM /
118 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE-5% 250-GAL. $0.2773 J WET LB.
TOTES '
119 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% 5-GAL. No Bid WET LB.
CARBOYS
120 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 12.5% | 300-2,000 GAL. No Bid WET LB.
BULK /
121 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% SMALL BULK s
**15% Sodium Hypochlorite by Volume, 400 - 1,000 $0.212 WET LB.
155 By Weiort GAL. deliveries |
122 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — 15% LARGE BULK $0 168** /
**15% Sodium Hypochlorite by Volume, 1,001 -7,000 ’ WET LB.
12.5% by Weight** GAL. deliveries
123 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% BULK )
Certified Refrigerated Storage | (400-5,000 GAL. | NO Bid
and Delivery (Alternative Bid) deliveries) WET LB.
124 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 55-GAL. 44 \/ WET LB.
DRUMS $0.29 ;
125 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - 15% 275-GAL. $0.2500 .v/ WET.LB.
TOTES '
126 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 30-GAL. . WET LB.
conTainer | Vo Bid /
127 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 15-GAL. $0.5040 \/, WET LB.
CONTAINER '
128 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 5-GAL. No Bid WET LB.
CONTAINER o Bl
129 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE- 15% 1-GAL. No Bid WET LB.
CONTAINER @ B
DRUM No Bid /
131 SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE 50-LBS. $2.56 \/ DRY LB.
BAGS
132 SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2-KG. No Bid DRY KG.
(penta-hydrate) BAGS
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NEW ITEM SODIUM THIOSULFATE 5- GAL. GAL
-133 (30% SOLUTION) DRUM No Bid
134 SULFUR DIOXIDE BULK No Bid PER TON
/
135 THIOSULPHATE — CALCIUM 275-GAL. $8.01 \/( PER GAL.
(30%) TOTES
136 ZINC HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. . DRY LB.
(V-937 OR EQUAL BAGS No Bid
137 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. WET. LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) TOTES No Bid
138 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK WET LB.
(V-970 OR EQUAL) No Bid
139 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 55-GAL. WET LB.
DRUM No Bid
140 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 50-LBS. . DRY LB.
(CARUS 3050 OR EQUAL) PAILS No Bid ;
141 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 30-GAL. ) GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS DRUM No Bid
3180)
142 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 275-GAL. No Bid GAL.
(SHANNON SLC 321 OR CARUS TOTES
3180)
143 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE 15-GAL. ) GAL
(CARUS 3180 OR EQUAL) PAILS No Bid
144 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK ) WET LB.
(SLI-932 OR EQUAL) No Bid
145 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid WET LB.
(V-939 OR EQUAL)
146 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK ) WET LB.
(UPZ-511 OR EQUAL) No Bid
147 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid WET LB.
(CARUS 3150 OR EQUAL)
148 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid GALLON
(CARUS 3300 OR EQUAL)
149 ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE BULK No Bid WET LB.
(SLI-939 OR EQUAL)
150 Emergency Pumping and Daily Fee: . Chemicals that
Storage Tanker to support No Bid bulk pumping
temporary on-site storage for and storage
utility that needs to repair will support:

containment vessel.
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PROPOSAL FROM:
Univar Solutions USA, LLC.

200 Dean Sievers Place

Morrisville, PA 19067

Telephone: ~ 215-495-8502 email: 1leana.caballero@univarsolutions.com

to furnish various bid products in accordance with specifications attached, it being further understood
that the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium (NEMVCC) and our Host Community
reserve the right to accept or reject any bids in whole or in part, and to reject any or all bids it shall be
deemed in the best interest of NEMVCC.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda: _ N/A

Signature: ‘JW &éﬂ-w)-o/

lleana Caballero, Municipal Specialist

To Whom it May Concern:

In accordance with the advertisement of the Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium inviting
proposals for furnishing Chemicals in conformity with the attached specifications, I/we hereby certify
that | am/we are, the only person (s) interested in this proposal as principal(s); that it is made without
collusion with any person, firm, or corporation, that an examination has been made of the specifications;
and that the equipment/materials will be delivered within the time specified, at the following prices.

SIGNATURES

qw&mw

Authorizing Signature

lleana Caballero, Municipal Specialist
Print Name and Title of Authorizing Signature

3/19/2024
Date
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| certify under the penalty of perjury that |, to the best of my knowledge, have filed all state tax returns
and paid all state taxes required under law.

*Signature of Individual or Corporate Name (Mandatory): Univar Solutions USA, LLC.

By: Corporate Officer (Mandatory, if Applicable): ‘J&M/ &—W

*Approval of a contract or other agreement will not be granted unless this certification clause is signed
by the applicant.

WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES

All prospective bidders on items that carry warranties and/or guarantees must include with their sealed
proposal a copy of the warranties and/or guarantees of major components as well as a copy of the
warranties and/or guarantees on the items being bid/proposal if applicable.

The bidder must plan to assure the owner that the warranties or guarantees can be assigned to the
owner. The owner’s intent is to use the extent of the coverage in the warranties or guarantees as part
of the awarding procedure.
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Univar Solutions , . I .

200 Dean Sievers Place ; U S

Morrisville, PA 19067-3700 ‘ n ' vc r O U t ' O n S
USA Innovate. Grow. Together

T 215-428-6990
F 215-337-6290

www.univarsolutions.com

March 19, 2024

Northeast/Merrimack Valley Chemical Consortium
c/o Savas Danos

71 Pine Valley CT

Rotonda West, FL 33947

RE: FY2024-2025 Invitation to Cooperative Bid

To Whom It May Concern:

Univar Solutions is pleased to provide pricing for the above bid, due March 21, 2024, and has
done so on the attached required paperwork.

Our contact information for all things bid and contract related, as well as the information for
your local branch, is also attached.

We look forward to hearing the results of your request. Please send bid tabulations to the
email address below.

Thank you,

Ileana Caballero-

Municipal Specialist

215-495-8502

Univar Solutions-Eastern Region
ileana.caballero@univarsolutions.com

muniteam-east@univarsolutions.com

Please Note: Seller shall indemnify Buyer for losses to the extent caused by Seller's negligence or breach of contract. Neither
party is liable for incidental or consequential damages. Seller's liability is limited to the purchase price of the goods. SELLER
MAKES NO WARRANTY OF MERCHANTABILITY OR FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE.

Please Note: Where applicable, any State, Federal or other appropriate taxes and/or the California Mill Assessment will appear
as separate line items on any invoices from Univar. If Univar’s offer (pricing) was inclusive of these charges — they will be backed
out of the “product” line item and shown as their own line item(s) at the time of billing.



Univar Solutions . .
200 Dean Sievers Place “ UnlvarSO’ utions
Morrisville PA 19067 novate Brew Tanothas

T 215 428-6990
F 215 337-6290

www.univarsolutions.com

Branch Contact Information

Bids and contracts: Univar Solutions USA Inc.
lleana Caballero, Municipal Specialist
200 Dean Sievers Place, Morrisville, PA 19067
(215) 495-8502**phone**
(215) 337-6290 **fax**
ileana.caballero@univarsolutions.com

Emergencies, chemical related: ChemTrec
(800) 424-9300

Emergencies, after hours: Main number:
(401) 781-5600 - please follow prompts

Mike Papa, Operations Manager
(401) 641-0544

Account Manager Billy DeSousa
508-259-6360

Orders and delivery:

(855) 888-8648
CustSolNorthEast@univarsolutions.com

Business hours are Monday — Friday, 8 am - 5 pm

Remittance address: Univar Solutions USA Inc.
62190 Collections Center Drive
Chicago, IL 60693-0621

Payment terms are Net 30 Days
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Q’ UnivarSolutions

CERTIFICATE OF SECRETARY

[, Jumoke Onibokun, hereby certify that:

1. Tamtheduly elected, qualified andacting Assistant Secretary of Univar Solutions
USA LLC, a Washington Limited Liability Company (the "Company"),andam a

custodian of the corporate records of the Company and am familiar with the

matters herein certified.

2. The below list of persons are authorized to execute, for and on behalf of the

Company, written municipal bids or municipal proposals for the sale of other

disposition of products upto $9 million handled by the Company.

Shawnasey McCarthy- Municipal Commercial Manager

Victoria Meakim - Municipal Specialist

Roise Holiday-Henry- Municipal Specialist

Jennifer Perras — Sr. Municipal Specialist

Shelley Riggle - Municipal Specialist

Stacy Ziegler- Municipal Specialist

Raven Claudio - Municipal Specialist

lleana Caballero — Municipal Specialist

IN WITENESS WHEREQOF, I have executed this Certificate of Secretary of the Company this 4% day of
January 2024.

State of Illinois )

)

County of DuPage )

DocuSigned by:

Jumoke. Pdbokwn

E7R1477ERBB4E470
Jumoke Onibokun, Assistant Secretary

This Certificate of Secretary was signed and sworn before me on this 4th day of January 2024 by
Jumoke Onibokun, Assistant Secretary of Univar Solutions USA LLC.

Seal

a
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L

OFFICIAL SEAL
SANEMA GORODETSKY
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
My Commission Expires 7/25/2026

AL A4 o

DocuSigned by:
M ¢ow
1 401...
Sanema Gorodetsky

Notary Public
My commission expires July 25, 2026




Form W'g

(Rev. October 2018)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

P Go to www.irs.gov/FormW3 for instructions and the latest information.

Give Form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Univar Solutions USA, LLC

1 Name (as shown on your income tax return). Name is required on this line; do not leave this line blank.

2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above
Univar Solutions USA

following seven boxes.

D Individual/sole proprietor or D C Corporation

single-member LLC

[[] Other (see instructions) »

3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification of the person whose name is entered on line 1. Check only one of the
D S Corporation

Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C corporation, $=S corporation, P=Partnership) » P
Note: Check the appropriate box in the line above for the tax classification of the single-member owner. Do not check Exemption from FATCA reporting
LLC if the LLC is classified as a single-member LLC that is disregarded from the owner unless the owner of the LLC is
another LLC that is not disregarded from the owner for U.S. federal tax purposes. Otherwise, a single-member LLC that
is disregarded from the owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner.

4 Exemptions (codes apply only to
certain entities, not individuals; see
instructions on page 3):

D Partnership D Trust/estate

Exempt payes code (if any}

code (if any)

{Applies to accounts maintained outside the U.S.:

§ Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.) See instructions.
3075 Highland Pkwy, Suite 200

Print or type.
See Specific Instructions on page 3.

Requester's name and address (optional)

6 City, state, and ZIP code
Downers Grove, IL 60515-5560

7 List account number(s) here {optional)

m Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other - -
entities, it is your employer identification number {EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to get a

TIN, later.,

Note: If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. Also see What Name and

Number To Give the Requester for guidelines on whose number to enter.

Soclal security number ]

or
[ Employer identification number _]

9111 -11]1314[7]|9]|3(5s

XX Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number {or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and
2. | am not subject to backup withholding because: {a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) | have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and
3.1am a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.

Certification instructions, You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding because
you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage interest paid,
acquisition or abandonment of secured opert;g cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and generally, payments

other than interest and dividends/yfu not

yed to‘sign the cewca&;\n, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the instructions for Part II, later.

Sign

Signature of
Here

U.S. person P

o Nelhadg )

1/07[90@4

: o<
General Instructions

Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise
noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments
related to Form W-8 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go to www.irs. gov/FormWwa.

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-8 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer
identification number (TIN) which may be your social security number
(SSN), individual taxpayer identification number (ITIN}, adoption
taxpayer identification number {(ATIN}, or employer identification number
(EIN), to report on an information return the amount paid to you, or other
amount reportable on an information return. Examples of information
returns include, but are not limited to, the following.

e Form 1099-INT {interest earned or paid)

¢ Form 1099-DIV (dividends, including those from stocks or mutual
funds)

* Form 1099-MISC (various types of income, prizes, awards, or gross
proceeds)

¢ Form 1099-B (stock or mutual fund sales and certain other
transactions by brokers)

¢ Form 1099-8 (proceeds from real estate transactions)

® Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party network transactions)
¢ Form 1098 (home mortgage interest), 1098-E {student loan interest),
1098-T (tuition}

* Form 1099-C (canceled debt)

* Form 1089-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person {including a resident
alien), to provide your correct TIN.

If you do not return Form W-9 to the requester with a TIN, you might
be subject to backup withholding. See What is backup withholding,
later.

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W= (Rev. 10-2018)




